

BOWLES RICE LLP
600 Quarrier Street (25301)
Post Office Box 1386
Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386
Telephone: (304) 347-1100
Facsimile: (304) 343-3058
Julia A. Chincheck
Mark B. D'Antoni
Daniel J. Cohn

*Special Counsel for the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI
EASTERN DIVISION**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,

Debtors.¹

**Chapter 11
Case No. 12-51502-659
(Jointly Administered)**

**FOURTH FEE STATEMENT OF BOWLES RICE LLP FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
NOVEMBER 1, 2012 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2012**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	Bowles Rice LLP
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Special Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession
TIME PERIOD:	November 1, 2012 through and Including November 30, 2012
CURRENT APPLICATION:	Total Fees Requested: \$ 84,069.63 80% of Fees Requested: \$ 67,255.70 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 4,027.38

¹ The Debtors are the entities listed on Schedule 1 attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors' chapter 11 petitions.

PRIOR APPLICATIONS:

First Fee Statement of Bowles Rice LLP for Professional Services and Disbursements for the Period of July 9, 2012 through August 31, 2012;

Second Fee Statement of Bowles Rice LLP for Professional Services and Disbursements for the Period of September 1, 2012 through September 30, 2012

Third Fee Statement of Bowles Rice LLP for Professional Services and Disbursements for the Period of October 1, 2012 through October 31, 2012

First Interim Application of Bowles Rice LLP for Allowance of Compensation

1. On July 9, 2012 (the "Petition Date"), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies ("Debtors") filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [ECF No. 1]. Debtors' cases are being jointly administered by order of this Court. [ECF No. 30].

2. Prior to the Petition Date, Bowles Rice LLP ("Bowles Rice") rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Bowles Rice – with this Court's authorization by its *Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Bowles Rice McDavid Graff & Love LLP as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [ECF No. 539] (the "Bowles Rice Employment Order") – *nunc pro tunc* from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services in connection with (collectively the "Authorized Representation"):

(a) to provide advice, representation and preparation of necessary documentation and to make all necessary filings regarding (i) coal and other property acquisitions, financings and other transactions and (ii) regulatory requirements involving coal properties and operations;

(b) to defend and provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding various litigation matters, including Federal Black Lung,

mining safety matters and bankruptcy matters where the Debtors are creditors of the bankrupt party or parties in interest in the bankruptcy case; and

(c) to provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding issues under local and state law relating to corporate and commercial matters.

3. In accordance with the Bowles Rice Employment Order and the *Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “Interim Compensation Order”), Bowles Rice, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its Fourth Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “Fee Statement”) for the period from November 1, 2012 through and including November 30, 2012 (the “Fee Statement Period”).

4. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Bowles Rice seeks payment of \$71,283.08 representing (i) 80% of Bowles Rice’s fees for services rendered and (ii) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Fee Statement Period.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Bowles Rice’s professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively the “Bowles Rice Professional(s)”) that rendered services for Debtors as authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. Exhibit A includes, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Bowles Rice Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Bowles Rice Professional, excluding paralegals.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Bowles Rice is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Bowles Rice during the Fee Statement Period for services authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by said Order. These services include all services that were typically rendered in the ordinary course or were being provided to Debtors before the Petition Date, but only as

specifically authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order in connection with the Authorized Representation.

8. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Bowles Rice, which provide the contemporaneous record summaries of the time spent by each Bowles Rice Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

9. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents (i) that she has read this Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of her knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within this Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Bowles Rice's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Bowles Rice does not make a profit on the services.

Notice

10. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq.; (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq., and Brian M. Resnick, Esq.; (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn: Leonora S. Long, Esq., and Paul A. Randolph, Esq.; (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq., and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq., and Ana Alfonso, Esq.; and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq., and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

11. WHEREFORE, Bowles Rice respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

DATED: January 7, 2013.

Respectfully submitted,

BOWLES RICE LLP

/s/ Julia A. Chincheck

Julia A. Chincheck (WV Bar No. 718)

Mark B. D'Antoni (WV Bar No. 4646)

Daniel J. Cohn (WV Bar No. 11916)

BOWLES RICE LLP

600 Quarrier Street (25301)

Post Office Box 1386

Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386

Telephone: (304) 347-1100

Facsimile: (304) 343-3058

*Special Counsel to Debtors and
Debtors in Possession*

SCHEDULE 1
(Debtor Entities)

1. Affinity Mining Company
2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
5. Big Eagle, LLC
6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
8. Black Walnut Coal Company
9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
14. Cleaton Coal Company
15. Coal Clean LLC
16. Coal Properties, LLC
17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
18. Colony Bay Coal Company
19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
20. Corydon Resources LLC
21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
24. Dakota LLC
25. Day LLC
26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
30. EACC Camps, Inc.
31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
39. Hillside Mining Company
40. Hobet Mining, LLC
41. Indian Hill Company LLC
42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
43. Interior Holdings, LLC
44. IO Coal LLC
45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC
51. KE Ventures, LLC
52. Little Creek LLC
53. Logan Fork Coal Company
54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
61. Newtown Energy , Inc.
62. North Page Coal Corp.
63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
64. Panther LLC
65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
67. Patriot Coal Corporation
68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
73. Patriot Trading LLC
74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
78. Remington Holdings LLC
79. Remington II LLC
80. Remington LLC
81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
82. Robin Land Company, LLC
83. Sentry Mining, LLC
84. Snowberry Land Company
85. Speed Mining LLC
86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
87. TC Sales Company, LLC
88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
92. Viper LLC
93. Weatherby Processing LLC
94. Wildcat Energy LLC
95. Wildcat, LLC
96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
97. Winchester LLC
98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I. PARTNERS/COUNSEL

NAME OF PARTNER/COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	1983 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	30.40	\$250.00	\$ 7,600.00
D'ANTONI, MARK B.	1987 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	31.20	\$235.00	\$ 7,332.00
DEJARNETT, DAVID A.	1989 - WV	TAX	0.80	\$262.40	\$ 209.92
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	1981 - WV	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	123.35	\$165.00	\$ 20,352.75
HUGHES, CHARLES	2001 - WV, KY	BUSINESS LITIGATION	12.80	\$205.00	\$ 2,624.00
LANE, J. THOMAS	1973 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	36.20	\$285.00	\$ 10,317.00
OBLAK, REBECCA	1988 - WV, PA, DC	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	14.40	\$275.00	\$ 3,960.00
SMITH, SARAH E.	1977 - WV	BUSINESS LITIGATION	28.20	\$165.00	\$ 4,653.00
TAWNEY, AMY J.		COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	0.20	\$213.20	\$ 42.64
TOTAL PARTNERS AND COUNSEL			277.55		\$ 57,091.31

II. ASSOCIATES

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
COHN, DANIEL	2012 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	0.70	\$114.80	\$ 80.36
CRISLIP, ANNA	2010 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	8.60	\$143.50	\$ 1,234.10
HANCOCK, THOMAS	2007 - WV	EMPLOYER LEGAL SERVICES	0.40	\$135.00	\$ 54.00
MCNAB, J. BRETON	2012 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	3.50	\$114.80	\$ 401.80
ROSE, HERSCHEL	2011 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	0.40	\$118.90	\$ 47.56
TOTAL ASSOCIATES			13.60		\$ 1,817.82

III. PARAPROFESSIONALS

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	79.30	\$70.00	\$ 5,551.00
HARRISON, KRISTEN	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	1.40	\$100.00	\$ 140.00
HARRISON, TINA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	26.50	\$70.00	\$ 1,855.00
LESTER, SHANNON	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	36.70	\$70.00	\$ 2,569.00
SMITH, TINA A.	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	15.40	\$70.00	\$ 1,078.00
TAYLOR, DEBRA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	74.65	\$70.00	\$ 5,225.50
VANCE, UTE	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	92.20	\$70.00	\$ 6,454.00
TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS		326.15		\$ 22,872.50

IV. ADMINISTRATIVE

NAME OF ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
BRAWLEY, LEIGH	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	30.90	\$70.00	\$ 2,163.00
ROTRUCK, ROBIN	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	1.00	\$125.00	\$ 125.00
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF		31.90		\$ 2,288.00

GRAND TOTAL		649.20		\$ 84,069.63
--------------------	--	---------------	--	---------------------

ATTORNEY BLENDED RATES

	ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS	TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES
PARTNERS/COUNSEL	205.70	277.55	\$ 57,091.31
ASSOCIATES	133.66	13.60	\$ 1,817.82
TOTAL	202.33	291.15	\$ 58,909.13

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

**ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY BOWLES RICE LLP ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD**

<u>CATEGORY OF EXPENSES</u>	<u>AMOUNTS</u>
Travel Expenses	\$33.86
Federal Express Corporation	\$177.94
Secretary of State	\$103.00
Miscellaneous Disbursements	\$956.60
United Parcel Service	\$76.16
Legal Computer Research Charges	\$200.37
Postage Charges	\$421.94
Long Distance Calls	\$94.71
Photocopy Charges	\$1,962.80
TOTAL	\$4,027.38

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Black Lung				507.60	\$49,955.25
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00007	DELP, CARNIS H.	9.10	\$637.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00026	GAMMON, WILLIAM T.	2.10	\$249.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00122	CONAWAY, DORWIN	1.50	\$105.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00180	LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG	0.30	\$40.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00333	SIZEMORE, HARRY	1.10	\$105.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00510	TOLER, ALVIN L.	7.60	\$703.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00694	BELCHER, TERRY K.	0.60	\$42.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835	ELLIS, DANNY R.	2.20	\$154.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00858	HALSEY, CLIFFORD O.	2.10	\$147.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00859	BROWN, WYLIE N.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	WRISTON, DONALD R.	3.00	\$286.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00870	TAYLOR, SAMUEL	1.20	\$131.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00880	WHITE, JERRY LEE	11.55	\$932.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00926	OVERTON, JAMES L.	18.50	\$2,967.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00969	WORKMAN, ERNEST JR.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00974	WILLIAMS, RILEY	3.40	\$352.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01026	CARTWRIGHT, THOMAS	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01043	SMITH, JOHN W.	6.20	\$624.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01071	MILAM, OMA, JR.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01109	DINGESS, LOUIS F.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01112	RICHARDSON, JAMES G.	2.50	\$194.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	LAMB, ALVIN J.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01166	CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE	1.80	\$126.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01176	GARDNER, PAUL R.	18.50	\$1,665.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01235	WHITTINGTON, RALPH E.	2.10	\$204.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01254	MASSEY, ROBERT E.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01317	CLINE, CARL H.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01377	MORGAN, AVERY R.	0.30	\$49.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01455	BLAIR, VERLIE JR.	2.80	\$196.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01531	ELKINS, CHARLES L.	3.50	\$378.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01542	NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR.	0.70	\$49.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01545	HOWERTON, ROOSEVELT (DECEASED)	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01583	LARRY A. HOWERTON	1.70	\$195.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01588	MUSICK, JOHN HENRY	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01618	HICKS, WALTER THOMAS	4.40	\$716.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01623	BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL	3.00	\$438.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01637	JOHN LYNN COOPER	3.80	\$380.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01649	ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY	9.80	\$809.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01650	VEST, ROY MICHAEL	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01676	LANDON B. LUSK	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01679	MARSHALL, JAMES MELVIN	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01689	MITCHELSON, HOWARD LEE	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01708	HARMAN, JOHN R	15.80	\$1,685.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01756	TAYLOR, ROBERT STEVINSON	2.50	\$289.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01760	BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR.	3.40	\$238.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01774	BLANKENSHIP, STEVENSON RAY	7.30	\$568.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01812	PRINCE, RICKY G.	1.80	\$297.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01834	BORING, WILLIAM J.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01854	GIBSON, EDWARD H.	0.30	\$49.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01858	MILAM, ROY LEE	4.40	\$308.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	MORGAN, STEVEN D.	1.20	\$84.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01934	AKERS, JERRY OTIS	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01953	SCOTT, HAROLD RAY	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01970	HELM, OMAR L. (FEDERAL BLACK LUNG)	1.00	\$70.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02032	EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM	3.40	\$352.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	LUSK, RALPH EMERSON	4.60	\$455.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02062	LUSK, RICKY N.	1.50	\$133.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	SALISBURY, PAUL B.	4.10	\$287.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	WOLFE, TERRY W.	4.20	\$408.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02173	LAWSON, WILLIAM R.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R.	4.40	\$412.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02188	ALLEN, JAMES	7.30	\$587.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02194	ERWIN, PAUL	5.50	\$385.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02220	KENNEDY, CLARENCE J.	10.25	\$1,073.75
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02235	BLEVINS, OAKLEY T.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02243	HARMON, WILLIE	19.55	\$1,876.75
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	RANKIN, LOWELL W.	20.75	\$2,701.75
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02257	PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A.	18.00	\$1,592.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02260	FRAZIER, PAUL (VICKI CAIN, DAUGHTER)	4.20	\$598.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02281	FULK, JR., RUSSELL	16.70	\$1,549.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02288	WILSON, LENNIE L.	26.40	\$3,396.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02292	MUSICK, HAROLD	7.40	\$603.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02299	HARRIS, JERRY L. SR.	2.80	\$196.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02320	FREETAGE, ALLEN M.	2.90	\$250.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02328	PERMELIA, DWARFUS D.	22.60	\$1,867.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02332	SHORT, DANNY	5.10	\$575.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02339	PICKETT, JACK E.	0.30	\$21.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02358	COUCH, ELBERT	1.40	\$136.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02367	BELCHER, ROBERT J.	4.60	\$436.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02403	THOMAS, ROBERT D.	3.40	\$238.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02409	THACKER, ROBERT R.	10.40	\$965.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02424	ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L.	9.00	\$725.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02433	GREENWOOD, LEWIS G.	12.00	\$1,220.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02435	GAMMON, WILLIAM A.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02448	GARZA, ELIEZER F.	2.30	\$199.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	CONRAD, NORMAN	3.20	\$271.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02454	DEAVERS, VERNON D.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02455	GURSKI, CHARLES R.	6.60	\$671.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02460	FITZPATRICK, MARTIN	0.80	\$66.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02465	MCCOY, GEORGE F	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02476	BRADFORD, JOHN E.	2.00	\$140.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02484	ALDERMAN, ALVIS E.	0.50	\$35.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02487	WILLIAMS, KEITH	0.50	\$35.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02492	TUCKER, RICKEY	8.30	\$676.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02495	ROBERTS, FREEMAN	0.20	\$33.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02496	JACKSON, JACKIE	0.30	\$30.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02509	BOYCE, RONALD	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02534	ROBERTS, SIDNEY E.	1.40	\$98.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02555	GRAHAM, JAMES G.	2.40	\$196.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02558	SNODGRAS, PHILLIP D.I	1.00	\$70.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02564	MELTON, ROBERT E.	3.00	\$305.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02566	HALL, ALVIN G.	1.40	\$164.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02569	OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02570	HORVWALT, ROBERT D.	0.70	\$49.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02572	FRANCIS, ROY W.	2.10	\$147.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02573	BILBRO, JAMES N.	1.10	\$77.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02575	BURNS, JERRY LEE	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02577	PORTER, ALAN (LORI)	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02579	DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH)	0.70	\$49.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02580	WORKMAN, LEROY E.	1.50	\$162.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02582	MILLER, GEORGE E.	1.90	\$199.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02583	SCOTT, HAROLD WILLIAM	2.10	\$213.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02584	WEST, DAVID G.	1.00	\$108.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	GIBSON, JAMES LEVI	4.40	\$422.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	PRICHARD, DOUGLAS M.	5.00	\$540.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02587	SHAFFER, TED RUDOLPH	1.30	\$157.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02588	CARTER, DALLAS R.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02589	KERSHAW, THOMAS E.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02590	GILLENWATER, JAMES R.	1.80	\$183.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02591	WALKER, MICHAEL W.	3.60	\$385.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02592	TOMBLIN, GARY DALE	2.50	\$232.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02593	ACORD, IVAN M.	1.70	\$166.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02594	ZORNES, CAROLYN J.	4.60	\$436.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02595	CHENEY, KENNETH P.	4.40	\$460.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02596	UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L.	2.70	\$189.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02597	COOK, RAYMOND L.	3.80	\$380.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02598	LINVILLE, GREGORY C.	3.40	\$352.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02599	NOBLE, BUFORD E.	2.90	\$326.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00008	KINCAID, MILTON	0.20	\$14.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00009	LOUDERMILK, PAUL W.	0.10	\$7.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00016	WELCH, RUSSELL J. V. EACC	2.50	\$222.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00017	CRAWFORD, ROBERT E.	1.30	\$91.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00022	MILLER, DAVID (LADONNA)	0.90	\$120.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00037	HARVEY, MILTON C.	0.80	\$84.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00042	BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W.	3.10	\$397.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00044	COOK, ROBERT	0.20	\$14.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00051	TURNER, JOSEPH D.	4.20	\$398.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00072	AMOS, DENNIS C.	2.40	\$168.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00096	DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE	2.90	\$288.50
Commercial				52.40	\$11,553.66
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00063	2012 LOAN TRANSACTION	40.00	\$8,453.66
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5523.00001	FIRM RETENTION	12.40	\$3,100.00
Energy & Real Estate				73.50	\$18,441.28
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00001	GENERAL REPRESENTATION	3.30	\$549.04
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00059	SALE OF SHREWSBURY PROPERTY TO PARDEE RESOURCES	40.90	\$11,032.32
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00065	SIERRA CLUB MINING AGREEMENT	6.00	\$1,710.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00066	MECHANIC'S LIENS	23.30	\$5,149.92
Litigation				0.30	\$34.44
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00061	PANTHER BRANCH COAL COMPANY AND	0.30	\$34.44
Safety and Health				15.40	\$4,085.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00066	HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619	8.60	\$2,290.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00071	HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168	6.80	\$1,795.00
TOTAL HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED:				649.20	\$84,069.63

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

Bowles Rice LLP
Time Detail by Project

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
BLACK LUNG					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02593	ACORD, IVAN M.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC TO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.30	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND REVISE LITIGATION PLAN
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		ACORD, IVAN M. TOTAL		1.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01649	ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY			
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/26/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/26/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/26/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND LETTER TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW EVIDENCE TO DATE, HEARING NOTICE, DEADLINE FOR EVIDENCE SUMMARY, AND DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR 2011 ZALDIVAR FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.30	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO MR WOLFE FORWARDING ZALDIVAR FILMS
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUEST FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND X-RAY FILM STATUS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/28/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR INFORMATION PERTAINING TO PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND DRAFTING INITIAL PREHEARING REPORT PURSUANT TO PENDING DEADLINE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.50	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR ADULT DEPENDENT CHILD INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.50	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/30/2012	3.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES, REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS.
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH RESPONSES TO REQUESTS FOR ADMISSION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEW REQUESTS FOR ADMISSIONS, CASE MATERIALS AND PROPOSED RESPONSES
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES SERVED ON OPERATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY TOTAL		9.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01934	AKERS, JERRY OTIS			
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AMENDED BENEFITS ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		AKERS, JERRY OTIS TOTAL		0.20	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	F0495.02484	ALDERMAN, ALVIS E.	11/02/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		0.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	F0495.02188	ALDERMAN, ALVIS E. TOTAL			
		ALLEN, JAMES			
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/13/2012	0.90	PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.70	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS FOR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.20	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE SOLOMON ENCLOSING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.20	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING READING OF DR. ZALDIVAR FILM
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.80	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR HIS INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION OF CLAIMANT
		HARRISON, TINA	11/16/2012	0.70	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT MEDICAL RECORDS NEED TO BE REQUESTED
		HARRISON, TINA	11/16/2012	1.40	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS TO BLUEFIELD REGIONAL HOSPITAL, EAST RIVER MEDICAL, CARLION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL, DR. CHANDEL AND DR. MCCLANAHAN AND X-RAY REQUESTS TO BLUEFIELD REGIONAL HOSPITAL, EAST RIVER MEDICAL AND CARLION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WIFE OF MR. ALLEN; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.10	DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION IN LIGHT OF CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S WIFE RE CONDITION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING RESCHEDULING OF EXAMINATION, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND DEADLINES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	CONFIRM CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01623	VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE RESCHEDULING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION AT CLAIMANT'S REQUEST (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED APPOINTMENT (.2)		
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM BLUEFIELD MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (.2)		
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/27/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH ESTHER FRAZIER AT CARILION ROANOKE HOSPITAL CONCERNING REQUEST FOR X-RAYS		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.20	ORGANIZE RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CARILION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.10	RECEIVE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CARILION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		ALLEN, JAMES TOTAL		7.30			
		BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL					
		SMITH, SARAH E.					
					11/02/2012	2.40	ANALYSIS OF PETITION FOR FEES BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; RELEVANT RESEARCH AND FILE ANALYSIS; DRAFTING OBJECTION TO PETITION;
					11/02/2012	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PREPARE COVER LETTER AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO FEE PETITION
					11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING RESPONSE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
			11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD'S RESPONSE BRIEF AND MOTION TO FILE OUT OF TIME AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
				3.00			
BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL TOTAL							
BELCHEER, ROBERT J.							
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02367						

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	1.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CABELL HUNTINGTON HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CABELL HUNTINGTON HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (3); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (2); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (3); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS AND PATHOLOGY SLIDES (3)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	1.10	REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT, MEDICAL RECORD REQUESTS, DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, MEDICAL RECORDS FROM VARIOUS FACILITIES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND REPORT FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ALKHANKAN AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION OF IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ALKHANKAN'S OFFICE
		BELCHER, ROBERT J. TOTAL		4.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00694	BELCHER, TERRY K.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. SULEIMAN AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02573	VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BELCHER, TERRY K. TOTAL		0.60	
		BILBRO, JAMES N.			
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.60	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS; TELEPHONE CALLS (2) TO MUHLENBERG COMMUNITY HOSPITAL CONCERNING RECORD REQUEST
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH MUHLENBERG COMMUNITY HOSPITAL CONCERNING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. THOMAS HOSPITAL
		BILBRO, JAMES N. TOTAL		1.10	
		BLAIR, VERLIE JR.			
		HARRISON, TINA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTED
		HARRISON, TINA	11/16/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
HARRISON, TINA	11/16/2012	0.30	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS (2ND) REQUESTS		
VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
HARRISON, TINA	11/20/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
HARRISON, TINA	11/20/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DR. AL-ASADI CONCERNING MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST		
HARRISON, TINA	11/20/2012	0.10	REVISE MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST TO DR. AL-ASADI		
LESTER, SHANNON	11/27/2012	1.80	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL		
BLAIR, VERLIE JR. TOTAL		2.80			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01774	BLANKENSHIP, STEVENSON RAY			
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINES FOR POST-HEARING EVIDENCE AND POST-HEARING CLOSING ARGUMENT DUE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.60	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DATE, DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS AND DIRECT ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY TO MEET DEADLINES

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS 1 THROUGH 3 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D. TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	2.00	REVIEWING ALL FILMS AND DRAFTING LIST OF ALL X-RAYS AND CT SCANS FOR ATTORNEY'S REVIEW
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (-1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. WHEELER (-1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. WHEELER (-1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.30	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY FOR EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.20	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.30	DRAFTING INDEX OF RELEVANT MATERIAL FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.30	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. WHEELER OF READING OF CT SCANS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	0.70	OBTAINING MATERIAL FROM CLAIM FILE FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		BLANKENSHIP, STEVENSON RAY TOTAL		7.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02235	BLEVINS, OAKLEY T.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGES DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BLEVINS, OAKLEY T. TOTAL		0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01834	BORING, WILLIAM J.			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); DOCKETING DUE DATE FOR RESPONSE TO FEE ORDER (.1)
BORING, WILLIAM J. TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02509	BOYCE, RONALD	11/12/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
BOYCE, RONALD TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02476	BRADFORD, JOHN E.	11/29/2012	1.30	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ACCESS HEALTH
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.60	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.3); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS TO CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER (.2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
BRADFORD, JOHN E. TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00859	BROWN, WYLIE N.	11/20/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
BROWN, WYLIE N. TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02575	BURNS, JERRY LEE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DENIAL OF BENEFITS ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE		0.10	
BURNS, JERRY LEE TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01760	BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR.	11/07/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL AND DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/07/2012	1.00	PREPARE AUTHORIZATION AND REQUEST TO DR. ESPIRITU, DR. LILLY, WELLMONT HOSP., NORTON HOSPITAL AND RALEIGH GENERAL HOSP. (.20 EACH).
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/08/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH DR. SMITH RE: STATUS OF REQUEST AND PREPARE SUPPL. REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION.
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SCOTT SMITH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. LILLY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02588	VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL REPORT FROM MOUNTAIN VIEW REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	1.00	REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. LILLY'S OFFICE FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.20	REVIEWING RESPONSE FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL FOR MEDICAL RECORDS
		BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR. TOTAL		3.40	
		CARTER, DALLAS R.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND POSSIBLE ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES
		CARTER, DALLAS R. TOTAL		0.10	
		CARTWRIGHT, THOMAS			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01026	VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CARTWRIGHT, THOMAS TOTAL		0.10	
		CHENEY, KENNETH P.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02595	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/08/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/08/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.70	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS FOR NEW CASE, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, STATUS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AS COMPARED WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASES; STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE NEW COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO DOL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	1.50	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM PRIOR COUNSEL FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (.2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT, EXAMINATION ARRANGEMENTS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT REGARDING EXAM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION RE DEADLINES, PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND ATTACHMENTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING NEW EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES FOR CLAIMANT (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM JOHNS HOPKINS REGARDING REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM
		CHENEY, KENNETH P. TOTAL		4.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01166	CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE			
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01317	VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT THIS TIME (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING WIDOW'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.1); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (.4)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.10	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1)
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/16/2012	0.60	DRAFTED RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR DR. BUSH REPORT AND RETURNED SLIDES
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00122	VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (.3)
		CLINE, CARL H. TOTAL		1.80	
		CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE TOTAL CLINE, CARL H.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE BRIEF AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CLINE, CARL H. TOTAL		0.20	
		CONAWAY, DORWIN			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. FINO REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. FINO REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION X-RAY FILM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. FINO REGARDING REPORT: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING REPORT
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. FINO REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT
		CONAWAY, DORWIN TOTAL		1.50	
		CONRAD, NORMAN			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.3); REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.30	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR REGARDING ATTORNEY FEES; CHECK STATUS AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN PLEADING TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE FEE AWARD
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REGARDING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1) REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/14/2012	2.00	PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL
		CONRAD, NORMAN TOTAL		3.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02597	COOK, RAYMOND L.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AS NOTICE OF APPEARANCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.70	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DOL EXAMINATION, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/15/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/15/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING OUR REQUEST FOR X-RAY FILM TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. WHEELER
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER/WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIM AND COMPLETING ALL EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES ON DOCKET
		COOK, RAYMOND L. TOTAL		3.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02358	COUCH, ELBERT			
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, STATUS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
COUCH, ELBERT TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02579	DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH)	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND RELEASE FORMS (.1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (.2)
DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH) TOTAL					
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF CT SCAN AND X-RAY FILMS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE REGARDING STATUS OF REPORTS (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. HADDADIN REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH) TOTAL					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02454	DEAVERS, VERNON D.	11/09/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
DEAVERS, VERNON D. TOTAL					
		SMITH, TINA A.		0.30	
DELP, CARNIS H.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00007	SMITH, TINA A.	09/06/2012	0.30	REVIEW EXISTING X-RAY FILMS TO DETERMINE UPDATE NEEDED AND PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO HOLMES.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/10/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH CARRIE OF HOLMES REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER RE: REQUEST.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/13/2012	0.20	PREPARE REVISED REQUEST TO HEALTHSOUTH WV AND AUTHORIZATION FOR MEDICAL RECORDS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/13/2012	1.00	RESEARCH AND TELEPHONE CALLS TO VARIOUS HEALTH SOUTH FACILITIES IN NORTHERN VA AND SOUTHERN WV TO LOCATE PROPER TREATING FACILITY.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/13/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF SEPARATE RESPONSES FROM PRINCETON HOSPITAL RADIOLOGY DEPT. AND MEDICAL DEPT. AND UPDATE STATUS SUMMARY.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/14/2012	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM HOLMES REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER AND TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH PATTY REQUESTING CD OF SCANS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/14/2012	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF HEALTH FIRST RADIOLOGY RECORDS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/14/2012	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF DR. PINTO'S MEDICAL RECORDS.
		LESTER, SHANNON	09/17/2012	1.30	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HOLMES REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/19/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH HEALTH SOUTH REGARDING REQUEST AND UPDATE SUMMARY.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/21/2012	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF RECORDS FROM ROANOAKE MEM. HOSPITAL AND UPDATE SUMMARY.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/24/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH SHANA OF DR. SABANOTO'S OFFICE RE: REQUEST.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/24/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF RADIOLOGY RECORDS FROM HEALTHSOUTH AND UPDATE SUMMARY.
		VANCE, UTE	09/24/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CARILION CLINIC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/25/2012	0.70	DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL AND SUPPL. INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE.
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	09/25/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. KEELEY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/28/2012	2.20	STARTED SORTING MEDICAL RECORDS INTO DATE ORDER
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/29/2012	1.30	FINISHED SORTING MEDICAL RECORDS INTO DATE ORDER
		DHELP, CARNIS H. TOTAL		9.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01109	DINGESS, LOUIS F.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		DINGESS, LOUIS F. TOTAL		0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01531	ELKINS, CHARLES L.			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MUSCARI AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. MUSCARI AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT (1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S, DR. OESTERLING'S, AND DR. WHEELER'S REPORTS (3)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.80	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. OESTERLING, REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.40	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (3); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF ZALDIVAR X-RAY FILMS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/27/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILM AND CASE MATERIALS TO CONFIRM EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT ON FILM COMPLETE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HASAN AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (2)
				3.50	
		ELKINS, CHARLES L. TOTAL			
		ELLIS, DANNY R.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.1)
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/26/2012	2.00	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC COPY OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL
				2.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02424	ELLS, DANNY R. TOTAL ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES, CASE MATERIALS REGARDING STATEMENT OF LISTED ISSUES IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES IN CASE REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/15/2012	0.30	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE COPY OF SUBMISSIONS AND DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.40	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ROSENBERG'S MEDICAL REPORT AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	1.00	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT SUMMARIZING PROCEDURE HISTORY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.40	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S MEDICAL REPORT AND UPDATING CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUSEL REGARDING CONTINUANCE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL.; TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING CONTINUANCE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.50	REVIEW INFORMATION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE STATUS AND CHECK FOR ANY ACTION ON MOTION FILED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE HEARING; REVIEW MOTION TO CONTINUE; DIRECT STAFF TO CANCEL DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/19/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE AND JOE WOLFE'S OFFICE CONCERNING DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	1.00	PREPARING CLAIM FILE AND EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.50	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S EXHIBITS FOR SUBMISSION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLERK OF JUDGE RE HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L. TOTAL		9.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02032	EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.50	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, INCLUDING STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES FOR LITIGATION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND APPROVE LITIGATION PLAN

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	1.60	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. MEYER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO DR. MEYER (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM TOTAL		3.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02194	ERWIN, PAUL			
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. SAMADDER, DR. KNIGHT AND DR. HAGGENJOS REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. SMADDER REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02460	VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HAGGENJOS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM JUDGE TO SCHEDULE MEETING	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/14/2012	2.50	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HAGGENJOS' OFFICE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		ERWIN, PAUL TOTAL		5.50		
		FITZPATRICK, MARTIN				
		VANCE, UTE		11/12/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISCS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (2)
VANCE, UTE		11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
VANCE, UTE		11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
VANCE, UTE		11/27/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. MARY'S MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION OF IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (1)		
FITZPATRICK, MARTIN TOTAL			0.80			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02572	FRANCIS, ROY W.				
HARRISON, TINA		11/01/2012	0.80	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS; PREPARE X-RAY REQUESTS TO RALEIGH REGIONAL CANCER CENTER AND RALEIGH HEART CENTER		
HARRISON, TINA		11/02/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DR. BARGHOUTT'S OFFICE CONCERNING X-RAY FILM AND UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE ACCORDINGLY		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02260	VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (-1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (-1)		
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/28/2012	0.90	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL		
FRANCIS, ROY W. TOTAL							
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02260	SMITH, SARAH E.	11/05/2012	0.40	FINALIZING AND SERVING RESPONSE TO FEE REQUEST BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/05/2012	0.10	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S FEE PETITION		
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/08/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING RESPONSE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1)		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/08/2012	0.30	PREPARE LETTER TO JUDGE LESNIAK AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S FEE PETITION		
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/15/2012	0.90	ANALYSIS OF LETTERS FROM COUNSEL AND OFFER TO SETTLE FEE DISPUTE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.50	REVIEW ADDITIONAL SUPPORT MATERIALS FAXED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; REVIEW ORIGINAL FEE PETITION AND OTHER FEE AWARDS		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.30	REVIEW RECENT FEE AWARDS AND FAX TO JUDGE AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.70	TELEPHONIC HEARING ON FEE PETITION WITH JUDGE AND OPPOSING COUNSEL		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	EMAILS TO AND FROM J. LINDEN RE FEE SETTLEMENT		
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DOCUMENTS BY CLAIMANT REGARDING FEE PETITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	DRAFT AND FAX NOTICE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE ATTORNEY HANDLING TELEPHONIC HEARING TODAY		
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		FRAZIER, PAUL (VICKI CAIN, DAUGHTER) TOTAL				4.20	
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. P0495.02320 FREETAGE, ALLEN M.					
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL REGARDING INVOICE		
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL. TELEPHONE CALL TO RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL REGARDING INVOICE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT THIS TIME (1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO ADMINISTRATOR OF ESTATE (-3)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S DAUGHTER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, REPRESENTATION STATUS, AND INFORMATION REGARDING ESTATE REPRESENTATION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FREETAGE, ALLEN M. TOTAL		2.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02281	FULK, JR., RUSSELL			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	0.50	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.60	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	1.10	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	1.20	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BRANITZ'S OFFICE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ALBARINI'S OFFICE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/06/2012	1.00	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN AND COVER LETTER
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR POST HEARING PENDING EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION BY EMPLOYER
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/06/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	1.50	APPEAR FOR HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	1.10	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT NEEDED POST HEARING, EVIDENTIARY ISSUES AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.30	DIRECT STAFF RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT SCHEDULE AND ACTION NECESSARY IN LIGHT OF ACTION BY JUDGE AT HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02435	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM JOHNSON CONCERNING THE SCHEDULING OF DEPOSITIONS	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
FULK, JR., RUSSELL TOTAL				16.70		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02435	GAMMON, WILLIAM A	11/30/2012	0.10	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE REGARDING DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA		0.10		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00026	GAMMON, WILLIAM A TOTAL				
		GAMMON, WILLIAM T.	11/12/2012	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/12/2012	0.70	REVIEW PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF CASE, ISSUES; CHECK FOR ANY INFORMATION OR EVIDENCE RELATIVE TO CLAIM FOR DEPENDENT DISABLED CHILD; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND CLAIM IN PRIOR CASE FOR DEPENDENT CHILD	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/12/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)	
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY	
		HANCOCK, THOMAS	11/21/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIALS AND ORDERS TO RESEARCH NEXT STEP IN LITIGATING CLAIM	
		GAMMON, WILLIAM T. TOTAL			2.10	
		GARDNER, PAUL R.				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01176	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX; AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS BETHESDA HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/03/2012	0.70	REVIEWING AND SUMMARIZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BUTTERFIELD'S OFFICE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/03/2012	2.50	REVIEWING AND SUMMARIZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.50	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM GENESIS HEALTH CARE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM GENESIS HEALTH CARE (2)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.50	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BUTTERFIELD'S OFFICE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.30	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ROSENBERG'S TESTIMONY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	1.00	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	1.10	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, EVIDENTIARY ISSUES, POST HEARING DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR POST HEARING PENDING EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION BY EMPLOYER
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/06/2012	1.00	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN AND COVER LETTER
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/06/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	1.70	APPEAR FOR HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM MOUNT CARMEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON DISC AND IMPORTING INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM JOHNSON CONCERNING THE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT COUNSEL
		GARDNER, PAUL R. TOTAL		18.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02448	GARZA, ELIEZER F.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE REGARDING REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01854	VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.60	REVIEWING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED (1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); PREPARING REVIEW PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (2); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME AND REQUEST TO COMPEL CLAIMANT (3)
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.50	REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT, DEADLINES, AND NEED FOR ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT TIME
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01854	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING DEADLINE CHANGE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	GARZA, ELIEZER F. TOTAL		2.30	
		GIBSON, EDWARD H. TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.30	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITER; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME; EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS RE STATUS
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	1.10	RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF B-READER REPORTS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM AND OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S FILM (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING STATUS OF REPORTS (1); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING CORRECT DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM BE SEND TO DR. WHEELER (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. MOUSHMOUSH AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (2) REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (3)
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.90	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH DOL EXAMINATION REPORT, TEST RESULTS, AND ISSUES; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC AND DR. MOUSHMOUSH; REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT BY DR. ZALDIVAR (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORTS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM AND OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S FILM (1); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (2)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.40	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (3); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.50	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT, DR. WHEELER'S READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM, AND DR. SCOTT'S READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM
		GIBSON, JAMES LEVI TOTAL		4.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02590	GILLENWATER, JAMES R.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE REGARDING STATUS OF READINGS (1); RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.30	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF REBUTTAL AND AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE ON BEHALF OF OPERATOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02555	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)		
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE (1)		
GILLENWATER, JAMES R. TOTAL				1.80			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02433	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/26/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/26/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (1); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (2)		
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.40	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL		
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/27/2012	1.50			
		GRAHAM, JAMES G. TOTAL				2.40	
		GREENWOOD, LEWIS G.					
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY FOR JUDGE, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, ISSUES		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE		
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/01/2012	1.00	PREPARED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND HEARING SUMMARY IN ACCORDANCE WITH 5 DAY JUDGE ORDER		
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.50	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION		
HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.80	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION (NOT SENT)				
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUSNEL REGARDING DEPOSITION				
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.30	CHECK STATUS OF DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND INFORMATION RE SAME, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION RE DEADLINES				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MICHELE NEWLON AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.50	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INVOICE FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		HARRISON, TINA	11/06/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS FOR NEW EVIDENCE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/06/2012	0.10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/06/2012	0.20	CALL FROM APRIL WITH JUDGE SILVAIN'S OFFICE REGARDING MOVING HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	0.50	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, INFORMATION FROM CLERK OF JUDGE RE ATTEMPTS TO CONTACT CLAIMANT, AND CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RE SAME AND SCHEDULING ISSUES
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/07/2012	0.50	DRAFTED MOTION TO HOLD RECORD OPEN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.90	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT NEEDED POST HEARING, EVIDENTIARY ISSUES AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	1.20	APPEAR FOR HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL FROM ST. ANNS MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GOOD SAMARITAN HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.30	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM GOOD SAMARITAN HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL, DR. ROSENBERG AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/16/2012	0.40	DRAFTED AND PREPARED PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION EVIDENCE SUBMISSION
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		GREENWOOD, LEWIS G. TOTAL		12.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02455	GURSKI, CHARLES R.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.60	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS FOR NEW CASE, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; DOL EXAM REPORT AND TEST RESULTS; EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN APPEARANCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REPORT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC TO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.30	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. RASMUSSEN AND DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT ACCORDINGLY
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AVAILABLE AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, ISSUES AND TREATMENT RECORDS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILMS BEING SENT TO JOHNS HOPKINS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS RE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02566	VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.60	REVIEWING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED (1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); PREPARING REVIEW PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (2)	
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.30	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE FOR AFFIRMATIVE AND REBUTTAL DEADLINES	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME	
		GURSKI, CHARLES R. TOTAL 6.60				
		HALL, ALVIN G.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO DENIAL ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)	
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, AND CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORD DEVELOPMENT	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR	
VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE			
HALL, ALVIN G. TOTAL 1.40						
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00858	VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/15/2012	2.00	PREPARED ELECTRONIC COPY OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL	
		HALSEY, CLIFFORD O. TOTAL 2.10				
		HARMAN, JOHN R				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01708	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION DR. ROSENBERG	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT'S FOR PENDING HEARING	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/03/2012	1.50	REVIEWING AND SUMMARIZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	1.50	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.70	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	1.40	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, EVIDENTIARY ISSUES, POST HEARING DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	1.00	TRAVEL TO COLUMBUS, OHIO, FOR HEARING
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT 11 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	2.00	APPEAR FOR HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.30	DIRECT STAFF RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT SCHEDULE AND ACTION NECESSARY IN LIGHT OF ACTION BY JUDGE AT HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	CONFIRM DEPOSITION ARRANGEMENTS AND DATES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
					REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM JOHNSON CONCERNING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.40	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARMAN, JOHN R TOTAL		15.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02243	HARMON, WILLIE			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DR. SILK'S OFFICE CONCERNING MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE ACCORDINGLY
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT MEDICAL RECORDS ARE OUTSTANDING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM STEVENS CLINIC REGARDING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO STEVENS CLINIC REGARDING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITIONS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL
		HARRISON, TINA	11/09/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LEONARD STAYTON'S OFFICE CONCERNING REQUEST FOR X-RAYS
		HARRISON, TINA	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS FOR X-RAYS RECEIVED
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/12/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO LOCATE X-RAYS REQUESTED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	1.25	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, EVIDENCE, ISSUES; PREPARE FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/13/2012	2.50	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD'S OFFICE PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/13/2012	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.40	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING TRANSCRIPT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/13/2012	1.50	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DUKE UNIVERSITY PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/13/2012	0.70	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S COPY OF EXHIBITS FOR SUBMISSION AND DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/13/2012	1.00	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL AND FILE FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	4.10	TRAVEL AND APPEAR FOR HEARING IN BECKLEY, WV
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LEONARD STAYTON'S OFFICE CONCERNING REQUESTED X-RAYS AND CT SCANS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.80	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS AND MAIL LOG TO LOCATE FILMS FROM MED EXPRESS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02299	VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING RETURN OF COMPACT DISC MAILED TO HIM FOR READING OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS	
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		HARRISON, TINA	11/27/2012	0.10	E-MAILS TO/FROM DOUG KORDEK CONCERNING 3/20/11 FILM	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		HARMON, WILLIE TOTAL			19.55	
		HARRIS, JERRY L, SR.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER REGARDING DEPOSITION			
HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE			
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION			
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION			
VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE			
VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE			
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER REGARDING DEPOSITION			
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FORM DR. HAGGENJOS REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS			
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION			
HARRIS, JERRY L, SR. TOTAL			2.80			
HELM, OMAR L. (FEDERAL BLACK LUNG)						

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MAITER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.80	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.4); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CLAIMANT'S PRIMARY CARE PHYSICIAN (.2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
HELM, OMAR L. (FEDERAL BLACK LUNG) TOTAL 1.00					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01618	HICKS, WALTER THOMAS			
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/14/2012	2.50	REVIEW AND EDIT CLOSING ARGUMENT
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/16/2012	1.80	REVIEW AND EDIT CLOSING ARGUMENT
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S CLOSING ARGUMENT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
HICKS, WALTER THOMAS TOTAL 4.40					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02570	HORVWALT, ROBERT D.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND REPORTS FROM WEST VIRGINIA UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT THIS TIME (.2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.1)
HORVWALT, ROBERT D. TOTAL 0.70					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01545	HOWERTON, ROOSEVELT (DECEASED)			
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM UNDERWRITERS SAFETY & CLAIMS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); IMPORTING FILE CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2)
HOWERTON, ROOSEVELT (DECEASED) TOTAL 0.30					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02496	JACKSON, JACKIE			
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW RESPONSE OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO CONTEST OF ADDITIONAL ISSUES

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01637	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE	
		JACKSON, JACKIE TOTAL		0.30		
		JOHN LYNN COOPER				
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.70	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS FOR NEW CASE, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; DOL EXAM REPORT AND TEST RESULTS; EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN APPEARANCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR	
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REPORT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER			
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT			
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION			
VANCE, UTE			11/05/2012	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (.2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD (.2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1)	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC TO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		JOHN LYNN COOPER TOTAL		3.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02220	KENNEDY, CLARENCE J.			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	3.25	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, EVIDENCE, ISSUES, TO PREPARE FOR HEARING; APPEAR AT HEARING IN ZANESVILLE, OHIO
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. KNIGHT REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT AND CONTACTING ATTORNEY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. CHENDRAJ REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.60	EXTENDED TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02589	HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM JOHNSON CONCERNING THE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		KENNEDY, CLARENCE J. TOTAL		10.25	
		KERSHAW, THOMAS E.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING COMPLETE SOCIAL SECURITY EARNINGS RECORDS AS WELL AS NAME OF COMPANY NAMED AS RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
		KERSHAW, THOMAS E. TOTAL		0.10	
		LAMB, ALVIN J.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LAMB, ALVIN J. TOTAL		0.20	
		LONDON B. LUSK			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01676	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S PETITION FOR REVIEW AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LONDON B. LUSK TOTAL		0.20	
		LARRY A. HOWERTON			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01583	VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); COMPLETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO RECEIPT OF PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER (1); RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR APPROVING WITHDRAWAL OF CASE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF WITHDRAWAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS RE STATUS; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS RE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MAITER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02173	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/27/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS, CASE MATERIALS AND RESPOND BY EMAIL
		LARRY A. HOWERTON TOTAL		1.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02173	LAWSON, WILLIAM R.	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. CASTLE AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA			
		LAWSON, WILLIAM R. TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02598	LINVILLE, GREGORY C.	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.50	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, INCLUDING STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES FOR LITIGATION AND REVIEW AND APPROVE LITIGATION PLAN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00180	VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	1.60	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. MEYER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO DR. MEYER (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED BY E-MAIL AND ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)		
		LINVILLE, GREGORY C. TOTAL		3.40			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	FRAMPTON, PAULE	11/02/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS; CHECK CASE MATERIALS FOR STATUS; EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS RE SAME		
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DENIAL OF BENEFITS ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE		
		LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG TOTAL		0.30			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF EVIDENCE		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. FIGUERIA'S OFFICE		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	1.20	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. RASIS OFFICE		
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEWING HEARING CANCELLATION ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKETING CALENDAR ACCORDINGLY		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL TO VERIFY HEARING CONTINUED		
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/15/2012	1.40	RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES, REQUESTS FOR ADMISSIONS, AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; ANALYSIS OF EVIDENCE		
				LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG TOTAL		3.40	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02062	LUSK, RALPH EMERSON TOTAL LUSK, RICKY N.		4.60	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/01/2012	0.40	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/01/2012	0.20	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/01/2012	0.40	REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (.1) DRAFT SUPPL. INTERROGATORIES, AUTHORIZATION AND LETTER TO COUNSEL.
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LUSK, RICKY N. TOTAL		1.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01679	MARSHALL, JAMES MELVIN			
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CORRECTED DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		MARSHALL, JAMES MELVIN TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01254	MASSEY, ROBERT E.			
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/09/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
		MASSEY, ROBERT E. TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02465	MCCOY, GEORGE F			
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/09/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
		MCCOY, GEORGE F TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02564	MELTON, ROBERT E.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL(.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (.1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01071	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	1.00	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (2); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATED OF KINGSPORT AND FROM WISE CAVALIER CLINIC AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (5); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (2)	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/19/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)	
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO DENIAL OF MODIFICATION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/19/2012	0.60	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/19/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR	
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		MELTON, ROBERT E. TOTAL			3.00	
		MILAM, OMA, JR.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S PETITION FOR REVIEW AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		MILAM, OMA, JR. TOTAL			0.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01858	SMITH, TINA A.	11/05/2012	0.40	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.	
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/05/2012	1.40	PREPARE REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND AUTHORIZATION TO PRINCETON COMM. CENTER, OCEANA MEDICAL, FAMILY HEALTH CARE, CAMC, DR. MCFARLANE, NORTON COMM. AND RALEIGH GENERAL (20 EACH).	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO CHRONOLOGICAL DATE ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (2)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/29/2012	1.50	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.60	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS; VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT; DRAFTING REQUEST TO CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		MILAM, ROY LEE TOTAL		4.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02582	MILLER, GEORGE E.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/12/2012	0.60	REVIEW STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN RECORD
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO SSAE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01689	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.80	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (2); DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING SCHEDULING ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS FROM CLAIMANT (1); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/12/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		MILLER, GEORGE E. TOTAL MITCHELSON, HOWARD LEE		1.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01377	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		MITCHELSON, HOWARD LEE TOTAL MORGAN, AVERY R.		0.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.30	EMAIL TO L. KLAUS RE POTENTIAL AMICUS BRIEF ON ISSUES IN A. MORGAN CASE
		MORGAN, AVERY R. TOTAL MORGAN, STEVEN D.		0.30	
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MOSES CONE MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM WAKE FOREST HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RADIOLOGY REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH SUSAN OF ANNIE PENN HOSPITAL RE: REQUEST.
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM ANNIE PENN HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF 4 COMPACT DISCS FROM ANNIE PENN HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (.3)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM WAKE FORREST UNIVERSITY REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		MORGAN, STEVEN D. TOTAL		1.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02292	MUSICK, HAROLD			
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	1.60	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.40	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND BEING DEVELOPED; CONFIRM MATERIALS TO SEND
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.10	UPDATE CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.50	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/02/2012	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ROSENBERG FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING PHONE CALL FROM OFFICE OF JUDGE, AND REVIEW HEARING INFORMATION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING MOTION TO CONTINUE, POSITION REGARDING CONTINUING, DIRECT INFORMATION BE PROVIDED TO CLERK OF JUDGE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/06/2012	0.20	CALLS FROM APRIL WITH JUDGE SILVAIN'S OFFICE REGARDING MOTION TO CONTINUE DUE TO CLAIMANT'S ILLNESS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01588	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER AND CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MUTCHLER AND CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. MUTCHLER AND CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL DR. MUTCHLER REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		MUSICK, HAROLD TOTAL			7.40	
		MUSICK, JOHN HENRY				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01542	VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL'S OFFICE REGARDING CLOSING ARGUMENT	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL	
		MUSICK, JOHN HENRY TOTAL			0.40	
		NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS AMENDED NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL TO VERIFY HEARING CONTINUED	
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING HEARING CANCELLATION ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKETING CALENDAR ACCORDINGLY	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION	
		NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR. TOTAL			0.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02599	NOBLE, BUFORD E.				
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MAITER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02569	FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	0.60	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, INCLUDING STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, DOL EXAM REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES FOR LITIGATION	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND APPROVE LITIGATION PLAN	
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	1.60	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED BY E-MAIL AND ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)	
		NOBLE, BUFORD E. TOTAL			2.90	
		OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN				
		VANCE, UTE				
		OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN TOTAL			0.20	
		OVERTON, JAMES L.				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00926	SMITH, SARAH E.	11/07/2012	6.00	FILE ANALYSIS AND OUTLINING CLOSING ARGUMENT	
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); UPDATING DOCKET PURSUANT TO EXTENSION ORDER FOR FILING OF CLOSING ARGUMENT (1)	
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/12/2012	6.20	LEGAL RESEARCH AND DRAFTING CLOSING ARGUMENT	
		OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN TOTAL			0.20	
OVERTON, JAMES L.						
SMITH, SARAH E.						
VANCE, UTE						
OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN TOTAL			6.20			
OVERTON, JAMES L.						

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/13/2012	3.30	DRAFTING AND REVISING CLOSING ARGUMENT; ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL INFORMATION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CLOSING ARGUMENT TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CLOSING ARGUMENT TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		HARRISON, TINA	11/14/2012	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE HARRIS AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR EMPLOYER'S CLOSING ARGUMENT
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/14/2012	2.10	FINALIZING CLOSING ARGUMENT AND EFFECTING SERVICE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S CLOSING ARGUMENT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		OVERTON, JAMES L. TOTAL		18.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02328	PERMELIA, DWARFUS D.			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. MCSHARREY REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES, CASE MATERIALS REGARDING STATEMENT OF LISTED ISSUES IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES IN CASE REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. MCSHARRY REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. MCSHAREY REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING REPORT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
TAYLOR, DEBRA		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/09/2012	0.50	REVISING LETTER TO DOCTOR FOR CONSULTING OPINION; DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
TAYLOR, DEBRA		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/12/2012	0.50	UPDATING DRAFT OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM WITH ADDITIONAL SUBMISSIONS
TAYLOR, DEBRA		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/12/2012	0.40	REVIEWING READINGS OF FILM AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/12/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (1)
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND ISSUES
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	CONFIRM EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH REPORT
VANCE, UTE		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.60	BOOKMARKING DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT REPORTER (1)
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION ABOUT DEPOSITION ARRANGEMENTS AND CONFIRM SCHEDULE
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING REPORT
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CAL TO DR. MCSHARRY REGARDING DEPOSITION
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.50	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/15/2012	0.50	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (4); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. MCSHARREY REGARDING DEPOSITION PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE COPY OF SUBMISSIONS AND DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.60	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.40	UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY WITH ADDITIONAL REPORT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.50	REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/19/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1)
		HARRISON, TINA	11/19/2012	0.50	PREPARE COVER LETTER TO ALJ AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		HARRISON, TINA	11/19/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE CONCERNING HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REVIEW FOR DEPOSITION; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, ISSUES AND MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS
		HARRISON, TINA	11/19/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/19/2012	0.50	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.80	ORGANIZING AND BOOKMARKING DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR REVIEW FOR DEPOSITION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW ARRANGEMENTS FOR DEPOSITION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CLAIMANT'S REPRESENTATIVE, CASE MATERIALS AND RETURN CALL
		HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.40	REVISE LETTER AND INDEX TO ROSENBERG FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.60	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/29/2012	0.40	PREPARING CLAIM FILE AND EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	1.00	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.20	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S COPY OF EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLERK OF JUDGE RE HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION TO SUBMIT POST-HEARING EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.10	
				22.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02257	PERMELIA, DWARFUS D. TOTAL PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A.			
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES, CASE MATERIALS REGARDING STATEMENT OF LISTED ISSUES IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES IN CASE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.70	REVIEWING X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING X-RAYS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR EXPERT REPORT, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG WITH SAME PREPARE LETTER REQUESTING CONSULT TO DR. ROSENBERG AND INDEX OF DOCUMENTS
		HARRISON, TINA	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG
		HARRISON, TINA	11/09/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/12/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS MOTION TO FILE POST-HEARING EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.60	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/15/2012	0.20	DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT PURSUANT TO DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	1.00	CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL REPORT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.20	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE COPY OF SUBMISSIONS AND DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.70	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL. TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING REPORT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.40	DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING REPORT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (-2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (-1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.30	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1)
		HARRISON, TINA	11/21/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE CONCERNING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/21/2012	0.40	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/21/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LEONARD STAYTON CONCERNING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		HARRISON, TINA	11/21/2012	0.50	PREPARE LETTER TO JUDGE TIMLIN AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		HARRISON, TINA	11/21/2012	0.50	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY AND POST HEARING EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.50	REVIEW MOTION TO PRODUCE, CHECK STATUS OF FILM; REVIEW INFORMATION CONCERNING FILM AND FILM STATUS; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION REGARDING SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND CONFIRM INFORMATION REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULE CHANGES AND DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION REGARDING DEPOSITIONS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.30	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE, AND COMPARE WITH POST HEARING EVIDENCE NECESSARY AND BEING SCHEDULED
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES WITHOUT MEDICAL RELEASE AND RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION FOR PRODUCTION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/27/2012	0.10	E-MAILS TO/FROM DOUG KORDEK CONCERNING 3/09/11 FILM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.50	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.40	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER AND DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/29/2012	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND DOCUMENTS FOR FORWARDING TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND PREPARING CLAIM AND EVIDENCE FOR PENDING HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.50	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S COPY OF EVIDENCE FOR PENDING HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/30/2012	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN MOTION TO HOLD RECORD OPEN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLERK OF JUDGE RE HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.30	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, DEPOSITIONS AND NEED FOR POST HEARING DEVELOPMENT TIME
		PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A. TOTAL		18.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-02339	PICKETT, JACK E.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM JUDGE SILVAIN'S OFFICE REGARDING NEXT WEEK'S HEARING (.), UPDATING HEARING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY (.1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02577	VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PICKETT, JACK E. TOTAL PORTER, ALAN (LORI)		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF WIDOW'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	PORTER, ALAN (LORI) TOTAL		0.40	
		PRICHARD, DOUGLAS M.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REGARDING STATUS OF B-READER REPORT (1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); PREPARING MEDICAL REVIEW PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY REGARDING LITIGATION PLAN (2)
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.10	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES. PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW RADIOGRAPHIC REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL WITH REPORT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES AND DIRECT ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02586	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.40	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REPORT, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND IN CASE MATERIALS, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR WITH THE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01812	VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.40	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.2); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (.2)	
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (.1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO DR. BHASVAR (.1)	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEW CONSULTING REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND ISSUES	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION INTO RECORD	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.20	CHECK FOR ANY INFORMATION RE REPRESENTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY	
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.30	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING NEW EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT NEW DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.2)	
		PRICHARD, DOUGLAS M. TOTAL			5.00	
		PRINCE, RICKY G.				
		SMITH, SARAH E.				
		SMITH, SARAH E.				
		PRINCE, RICKY G. TOTAL				1.80
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	RANKIN, LOWELL W.	11/29/2012	1.00	ANALYSIS OF HEARING TRANSCRIPT TO OUTLINE ACTION NECESSARY FOR EVIDENCE SUBMISSION DEADLINE AND BRIEF; STRATEGY CONFERENCE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.80	ANALYSIS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORTS AND DEPOSITION; CASE STATUS REVIEW	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	RANKIN, LOWELL W.	11/01/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/01/2012	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILM AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE IN RECORD FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT EXHIBIT #5 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/01/2012	0.10	RECEIVE X-RAY AND RADIOLOGY REPORT FROM MINER'S MEDICAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	3.50	PREPARE FOR AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/02/2012	2.20	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/02/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS OF DEPOSITIONS OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG FOR EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.90	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND WITNESS LIST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	3.25	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, EVIDENCE, ISSUES, TO PREPARE FOR HEARING; APPEAR AT HEARING IN ZANESVILLE, OHIO
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS OF DR. ROSENBERG AND OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/08/2012	0.30	DIRECT STAFF RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT SCHEDULE AND ACTION NECESSARY IN LIGHT OF ACTION BY JUDGE AT HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/14/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO RECEIPT OF READINGS FROM DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED DEPOSITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM MINERS MEDICAL REGARDING X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	1.80	REVIEW REPORTS AND TESTIMONY OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG, REPORTS AND TEST RESULTS FROM ROSENBERG, KNIGHT, SCHAAF, AND BEGLEY IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/30/2012	2.40	DEPOSE DR. SCHAAF AND NOTES FROM DEPOSITION WITH SCHAAF REPORT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		RANKIN, LOWELL W. TOTAL		20.75	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01112	RICHARDSON, JAMES G.			
		FRAMPTON, PAULE E.	11/02/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING EXAMINATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RESCHEDULING EXAM
		VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT REQUESTING THAT 11/7/12 ZALDIVAR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION BE RESCHEDULED 9:1); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR RESCHEDULING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT CHECKING IF NEW DATE IS ACCEPTABLE (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED APPOINTMENT (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO CLAIMANT(.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY ARH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM BECKLEY ARH AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.2)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02495	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS TO FACILITIES AND PHYSICIANS REGARDING STATUS OF RECORD REQUEST (.3); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS TO OCEANA MEDICAL CENTER (.2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02534	VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT TO DETERMINE WHETHER ADDITIONAL RECORDS ARE AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME TO FORWARD TO DR. ZALDIVAR
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BHAVSAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		RICHARDSON, JAMES G. TOTAL		2.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	ROBERTS, FREEMAN	11/08/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL AND INFORMATION REGARDING EXAMINATION SCHEDULED AND DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION REGARDING EXAMINATION
		ROBERTS, FREEMAN TOTAL		0.20	
		ROBERTS, SIDNEY E.	11/05/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	1.10	PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL
		ROBERTS, SIDNEY E. TOTAL		1.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	SALISBURY, PAUL B.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO HEALTH FIRST.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH HEALTH FIRST DIAG. CENTER RE: RECORDS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.50	REVIEW MOST RECENT INTERROGATORY RESPONSES FOR NEW PROVIDERS AND RESEARCH ADDRESSES.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO PRINCETON HOSPITAL.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO HOLMES REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO BREVARD MEDICAL CENTER.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO DR. BALAYI.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO DR. SARACINO.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO HEALTHSOUTH.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO DR. KOHKAR.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO DR. KEELEY.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH DR. MANOMOHAN'S OFFICE RE: RECORDS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO ROANOKE HOSPITAL.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO OSLER MEDICAL CENTER.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR RECORDS TO DR. PINTO.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO PRINCETON HOSPITAL.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO HEALTHSOUTH.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO ROANOKE.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO OSLER MEDICAL.
		SMITH, TINA A.	09/05/2012	0.20	PREPARE REQUEST AND AUTHORIZATION FOR X-RAYS TO BREVARD HEALTH.
		SALISBURY, PAUL B. TOTAL		4.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01953	SCOTT, HAROLD RAY			
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		SCOTT, HAROLD RAY TOTAL		0.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02583	SCOTT, HAROLD WILLIAM			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	1.00	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (2); DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING SCHEDULING ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS FROM CLAIMANT (1); DRAFTING RENEWED REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. FOREHAND (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.40	REVIEW SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, DOL EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS, CASE MATERIALS AND RESPOND
		SCOTT, HAROLD WILLIAM TOTAL		2.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02587	SHAFFER, TED RUDOLPH			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM UNDERWRITERS; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, CONFIRM STATUS WITH UNDERWRITERS
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORTS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.40	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		SHAFFER, TED RUDOLPH TOTAL		1.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02332	SHORT, DANNY			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.80	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM VARIOUS FACILITIES AND DESIGNATE RECORDS FOR EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/02/2012	0.20	REVIEW RECORDS BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM COSHOCTON HOSPITAL
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC TO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION DATE AND TIME (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT TO CLAIMANT (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING IME SCHEDULING AND DATES AVAILABLE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUIRING ARGUMENT RE RELEVANCY OF MEDICAL RECORDS; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH RELEVANCY ARGUMENT RE MEDICAL RECORDS SUBMITTED

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT WITH DISCOVERY
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND RELEASE FORMS (1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REQUESTING STATUS OF REPORT (1)
		SHORT, DANNY TOTAL		5.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00333	SIZEMORE, HARRY			
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER REMANDING CLAIM TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR COPY OF DEATH CERTIFICATE AND COPY OF EXECUTRIX PAPERS TO WIDOW (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01043	SIZEMORE, HARRY TOTAL	1.10		
		SMITH, JOHN W.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY; HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION RESPONSES AND CORRESPONDENCE; ANALYSIS OF EXTENSIVE RADIOGRAPHIC EVIDENCE REQUESTED FOR PRODUCTION; UPDATING SERVICE
		SMITH, SARAH E.	11/01/2012	1.30	PROCESsing CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/02/2012	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. VISHNU PATEL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (6); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (2); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (2); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR UPDATED MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	1.20	REVISED EMPLOYERS ANSWERS TO CLAIMANTS INTERROGATORIES
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITIONS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/08/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND RECEIPT OF NOTICE OF CANCELLATION OF DEPOSITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.40	EMAIL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING POSITION ON CONTINUANCE MOTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW VOICEMAIL AND EMAIL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING CONTINUANCE, AND REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION CANCELLATION NOTICES FROM CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL TO VERIFY HEARING CONTINUED
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/12/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02558	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	REVIEWING HEARING CANCELLATION ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKETING CALENDAR ACCORDINGLY
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (.2)
		SMITH, JOHN W. TOTAL		6.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/13/2012	0.70	PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL
		SNODGRAS, PHILLIP D.I. TOTAL		1.00	
		TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.90	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW TEST RESULTS, PROBLEMS WITH EXAMINATION AND DISCOVERY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/01/2012	0.40	PREPARE AUTHORIZATION AND REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS TO MR. CARMEL EAST AND MT. CARMEL ST ANN'S HOSPITALS (.20 EACH)
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE ACTION REQUIRED.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.20	PREPARE AUTHORIZATION AND REQUEST TO OHIO STATE HOSPITAL REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.40	DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL AND FACILITY SPECIFIC AUTHORIZATIONS FOR CLAIMANT TO EXECUTE.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH WENDY OF DR. LIPPERT'S OFFICE FOLLOWING UP ON PREVIOUS REQUEST.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH DR. FIORINIS OFFICE FOLLOWING UP ON PREVIOUS REQUEST.
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/02/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH DR. WHITTINGTON'S OFFICE FOLLOWING UP ON PREVIOUS REQUEST.
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. GRODNER REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM RIVERSIDE HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MAITER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01756	VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/26/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MT. CARMEL AND PREPARE REVISED REQUEST FOR RECORDS AND AUTHORIZATION.
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. GRODNER REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R. TOTAL		4.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01756	TAYLOR, ROBERT STEVINSON			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.70	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PAYMENT OF BENEFITS, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, AUTOMATIC ENTITLEMENT, FINAL ORDER IN MINER'S AWARD, CONFIRM MINER'S CASE IS FINAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FOR STATUS OF CLAIMANT'S CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PAYMENT ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING STATUS OF MINER'S CLAIM AND COPY OF LATEST ORDER (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANTS WIDOW (.3)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS, STATUS OF DISCOVERY, DIRECT ACTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, ROBERT STEVINSON TOTAL		2.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00870	TAYLOR, SAMUEL			
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CONSULTING OPINION REPORT BY DR. ZALDIVAR (1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.40	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		TAYLOR, SAMUEL TOTAL		1.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02409	THACKER, ROBERT R.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND RECORD REQUESTS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/06/2012	0.30	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING AVAILABILITY OF EXPERT FOR CONSULTATION REPORT; REVIEW AND ISSUES AND DIRECT CONTACT WITH DIFFERENT EXPERT
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/06/2012	0.70	PREPARED EVIDENCE PACKET TO SUBMIT ZALDIVAR AND WHEELER REPORTS
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/06/2012	0.20	PHONE CALL TO DR. HIPPENSTEEL REGARDING A CONSULTING REPORT
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/06/2012	1.30	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED PACKET FOR EXHIBIT SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT.
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/07/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. TUTEUR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. TUTEUR (1)
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/07/2012	2.30	PREPARED PACKET TO DR. TUTEUR FOR MEDICAL REPORT FOR MAIL AND EMAIL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.30	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHN'S HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT WITH NEW EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. TUTEUR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/12/2012	0.50	DRAFTED & REVISED EVIDENCE PACKETS OF EMPLOYER EXHIBITS, PREHEARING REPORT AND EVIDENCE SUMMARY
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/12/2012	0.20	PREPARED SUBMISSIONS FOR EMPLOYER'S EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.80	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. TUTEUR; REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR; REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE REPORTS WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND IN CASE MATERIALS AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/14/2012	0.50	REVISED EVIDENCE SUMMARY PACKET AND EMPLOYER EXHIBIT SUBMISSIONS TO REFLECT CHANGE OF JUDGE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.40	PROCESSING MULTIPLE SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (3); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MULTIPLE SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL.(1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES WITHOUT MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUESTING SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		THACKER, ROBERT R. TOTAL		10.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02403	THOMAS, ROBERT D.			
		VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS EXHIBITS 1 AND 2 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS REQUEST TO RESCHEDULE INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION WITH DR.
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.40	ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/20/2012	0.20	MAKING ARRANGEMENTS FOR CLAIMANT'S HOTEL RESERVATION THE EVENING BEFORE HIS TIME WITH DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION: DRAFTING NOTICE OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		THOMAS, ROBERT D. TOTAL		3.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00510	TOLER, ALVIN L.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES, CASE MATERIALS REGARDING STATEMENT OF LISTED ISSUES IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES IN CASE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
		VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES SERVED ON OPERATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/07/2012	0.30	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S ANSWERS TO CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS.
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/09/2012	2.90	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S ANSWER TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.50	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF MINER'S CASE; CHECK STATUS OF MINER'S CASE; REVIEW INFORMATION FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING MINER'S CASE
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.40	REVIEW PATHOLOGY EVIDENCE; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.30	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND IN CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/14/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. OESTERLING (2), UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. OESTERLING (1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.50	TELEPHONE CALLS TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING FINAL ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE DECISION IN THE MINER'S CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER DENYING EMPLOYER'S MOTION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLERK OF JUDGE RE HEARING

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02592	TOLER, ALVIN L. TOTAL	11/01/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM UNDERWRITERS SAFETY & CLAIMS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); IMPORTING FILE CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2)		
		TOMBLIN, GARY DALE	11/15/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED (.1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2)		
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)		
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION RE DISCOVERY STATUS, RENEWED DISCOVERY AND DEADLINES		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.60	REVIEWING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED (.1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.2); PREPARING REVIEW PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (.2)		
		VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.30	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE FOR AFFIRMATIVE AND REBUTTAL DEADLINES		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME		
		TOMBLIN, GARY DALE TOTAL			2.50		
		TUCKER, RICKEY					
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02492	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
				FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO CONTINUE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME
				FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR ISSUES, PROPOSED STATEMENT OF ISSUES
				BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1)
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/05/2012	0.50	DRAFTED MOTION TO CONTINUE HEARING WITH PHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/12/2012	1.20	DRAFTED & REVISED EVIDENCE PACKETS OF EMPLOYER EXHIBITS, PREHEARING REPORT AND EVIDENCE SUMMARY
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/12/2012	0.80	PREPARED SUBMISSIONS FOR EMPLOYER'S EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	1.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER RESCHEDULING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/14/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.10	REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING DOCKET ACCORDINGLY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. THOMAS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (.3)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. SOLDANHA REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02596	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL. TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS	
		TUCKER, RICKEY TOTAL		8.30		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01650	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	1.60	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (.1); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. JAWORSKI (.2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1)	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1)	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS	
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND OF CLAIMANT'S MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L. TOTAL			2.70	
		VEST, ROY MICHAEL				
		VANCE, UTE				
					0.20	RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VEST, ROY MICHAEL TOTAL			0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02591	WALKER, MICHAEL W.				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF RETURNED, UNCLAIMED INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.30	CHECK DEADLINE AND STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE DEADLINE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES DESIGNATE EVIDENCE, REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW DEADLINES, PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (2)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.10	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS REGARDING RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.30	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.50	REVIEWING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (2); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02584	VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		WALKER, MICHAEL W. TOTAL		3.60		
		WEST, DAVID G.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF REREADINGS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE REQUESTING STATUS OF REPORTS (1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE	11/13/2012	0.20	CONFIRM EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE	11/13/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHN HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)	
		WEST, DAVID G. TOTAL		1.00		
		WHITE, JERRY LEE				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00880	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	1.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.40	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/15/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR	
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC AND RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAULE	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEW PROPOSED STATEMENT RE ISSUES; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE ISSUES AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/16/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS	
		WEST, DAVID G. TOTAL		1.00		
		WHITE, JERRY LEE				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC AND RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.40	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WHARTON MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); ORGANIZING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (3)
		VANCE, UTE	11/20/2012	0.60	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS INTO CHRONOLOGICAL DATE ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND REVIEW OF RECORDS (5)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/26/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/26/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW EVIDENCE TO DATE, HEARING NOTICE, DEADLINE FOR EVIDENCE SUMMARY, AND DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/26/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	1.25	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WHARTON MEDICAL CENTER
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	1.20	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	11/28/2012	0.20	DRAFTING FOLLOW-UP REQUEST TO CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER FOR MEDICAL RECORDS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01235	WHITE, JERRY LEE TOTAL		11.55	
		WHITTINGTON, RALPHE.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (-1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	CONFIRM DATES AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW DEPOSITION SCHEDULE, DATES AVAILABLE; DIRECT ACTION RE SAME
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.50	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.60	REVIEW STATUS OF EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS; REVIEW PATHOLOGY REPORTS FROM DR. CAFFREY, DR. OESTERLING, DR. GREEN AND COMPARE; DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/05/2012	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM HEALTHPORT REGARDING INVOICE
VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RELEASE FROM WIDOW AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BOUSTANI AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (-1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO CHRONOLOGICAL DATE ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR IMPORTING RECORDS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND FOR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (-1)		
SMITH, TINA A.	11/26/2012	0.20	REVIEW STATUS OF REQUEST FOR EXECUTRIX DOCUMENTS FROM PLFS. COUNSEL AND FACILITIES WANTING SAME TO PROCESS REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS.		
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF EXECUTRIX PAPERS		
SMITH, TINA A.	11/26/2012	0.10	REVIEW FILE MATERIAL TO DETERMINE IF PLFS. RETURNED EXECUTRIX DOCUMENTS.		
WHITTINGTON, RALPHE. TOTAL			2.10		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02487	WILLIAMS, KEITH			
		SMITH, TINA A.	11/09/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH RAM DIAGNOSTICS RE: RECORDS REQUESTED AND UPDATE SUMMARY.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		WILLIAMS, KEITH TOTAL		0.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00974	WILLIAMS, RILEY			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL REQUESTING PRODUCTION
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/29/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.50	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, INCLUDING STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES FOR LITIGATION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/29/2012	0.20	REVIEW AND APPROVE LITIGATION PLAN

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02288	WILLIAMS, RILEY TOTAL WILSON, LENNIE L.	11/29/2012	1.60	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RANAVAYA (3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO JOHNS HOPKINS FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)		
			11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION		
			11/01/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION		
			11/01/2012	0.40	DRAFTING INDEX AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW		
			11/01/2012	0.30	REVIEWING, DRAFTING INDEX, AND PREPARING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS FOR PENDING HEARING		
			11/02/2012	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT		
			11/02/2012	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING		
			11/05/2012	0.50	TRAVEL TO OHIO FOR HEARING		
			11/06/2012	1.00	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN AND COVER LETTER		
			11/06/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION		
			11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR POST HEARING PENDING EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION BY EMPLOYER		
			11/06/2012	2.40	PREPARING RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES; INSURING SERVICE AND CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; UPDATING RESEARCH; ANALYSIS OF RELEVANT X-RAYS		
						3.40	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
HARRISON, TINA		HARRISON, TINA	11/06/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGES CONCERNING MOTION TO HOLD RECORD OPEN
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/06/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING RESPONSE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1)
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/06/2012	0.20	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	1.50	APPEAR FOR HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/07/2012	1.30	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT NEEDED POST HEARING, EVIDENTIARY ISSUES AND PREPARE FOR HEARING
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING X-RAYS
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/07/2012	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.60	TRAVEL FROM HEARING IN COLUMBUS, OHIO
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/08/2012	0.30	DIRECT STAFF RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT SCHEDULE AND ACTION NECESSARY IN LIGHT OF ACTION BY JUDGE AT HEARING
BRAWLEY, LEIGH		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	CHECK STATUS OF DEPOSITION SCHEDULING; DATES
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/09/2012	0.60	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
HARRISON, TINA		HARRISON, TINA	11/12/2012	1.10	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
HARRISON, TINA		HARRISON, TINA	11/12/2012	0.70	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE FORWARDED TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/13/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.40	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR DEPOSITION; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ADDITIONAL CLAIMANTS EXHIBITS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/13/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/13/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. ZALDIVAR (1)
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DISCUSSING ISSUE WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING MOTION
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/18/2012	1.50	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORTS, ARTICLES REFERENCED IN REPORTS, PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.60	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR DEPOSITION AND CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR PRIOR TO DEPOSITION
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	2.00	TRAVEL TO AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	1.10	REVIEW ARTICLES AND REPORTS, PREPARE FOR CONTINUATION OF DR. ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/20/2012	2.90	MEET WITH AND DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.40	REVIEW EMAIL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND DEPOSITION EXHIBITS ATTACHED
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/21/2012	0.40	REVIEW RELATED MEDICAL ARTICLES AND REQUEST COPIES
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/26/2012	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING TRANSCRIPT
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	11/28/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM JOHNSON CONCERNING DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		WILSON, LENNIE L. TOTAL		26.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	WOLFE, TERRY W.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1) PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02135	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1) PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (1) PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	F0495.00969	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL REQUESTING PRODUCTION REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OR DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, STATUS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.70	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/20/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		WOLFE, TERRY W. TOTAL		4.20	
		WORKMAN, ERNEST JR.			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02580	VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PAYMENT ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		WORKMAN, ERNEST JR. TOTAL WORKMAN, LEROY E.		0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO DENIAL ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.50	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, AND CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORD DEVELOPMENT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		WORKMAN, LEROY E. TOTAL WRISTON, DONALD R.		1.50	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/04/2012	0.30	REVIEW DEADLINES, CASE MATERIALS REGARDING STATEMENT OF LISTED ISSUES IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES IN CASE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/05/2012	0.30	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTESTING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE
BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (1)		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE		
VANCE, UTE	11/06/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); UPDATING DOCKET PURSUANT TO CANCELLATION OF HEARING (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		VANCE, UTE	11/26/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. THAKKER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE ORDER IN PREPARATION OF ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (.1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.50	REVIEWING CD FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF CT SCANS
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1) REVIEW RADIOGRAPHIC EVIDENCE, FILMS AVAILABLE, CT SCAN FILMS OBTAINED AND DIRECT DEVELOPMENT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW FILMS BEING SENT TO JOHNS HOPKINS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS
		WRISTON, DONALD R. TOTAL		3.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02594	ZORNES, CAROLYN J.			
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/01/2012	0.20	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.70	REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT (.1) REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, INFORMATION ABOUT OTHER POTENTIAL RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR, ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		VANCE, UTE	11/01/2012	1.20	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (.2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. TOTAL	P5191.00072	BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/01/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.40	DRAFTING CONVERSION FORM, OPERATOR RESPONSE AND CONTROVERSION; OPERATOR RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF CLAIM AND COVER LETTER
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/09/2012	0.20	PROCESSING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REGARDING RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/09/2012	0.20	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S SPOUSE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED FROM OUR OFFICE (.1); REVIEWING LATEST NOTICE OF CLAIM RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR (.1); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING NEW CLAIM INFORMATION (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	11/14/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND POSSIBLE ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES (.1)
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/21/2012	0.50	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS
		ZORNES, CAROLYN J. TOTAL			4.60
489.00					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00072	VANCE, UTE	11/12/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM DRUID CITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (.1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION
		LESTER, SHANNON	11/27/2012	0.90	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MONOMANIA GENERAL HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00042	HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT MEDICAL RECORDS ARE NEEDED
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.30	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS TO HEISKELL KING BURNS & TALLMAN SURGICAL ASSOCIATES, AUGUSTA PULMONARY SPECIALISTS AND DRUID CITY MEDICAL CENTER (RESENT)
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	11/30/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DRUID CITY MEDICAL CENTER CONCERNING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST
		AMOS, DENNIS C. TOTAL		2.40	
		BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W.			
		VANCE, UTE			
			11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1);
					DOCKETING PETITION TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD DUE FROM ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S AWARD ORDER (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/12/2012	0.70	REVIEW DECISION OF JUDGE AWARDED BENEFITS, COMPARE WITH ISSUES, EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ARGUMENT
HARRISON, TINA	11/27/2012	0.80	PREPARE LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL, SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/27/2012	0.60	REVIEW ISSUES FOR APPEAL, EVIDENCE OF RECORD, ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE DECISION, AND SEND EMAIL TO J. LINDEN RE SAME		
BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (1)		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. LINDEN RE APPEAL AND DIRECT ACTION		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.30	REVIEW HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND RECORD DEVELOPMENT, DISCOVERY		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL		
BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W. TOTAL		3.10			
COOK, ROBERT					
VANCE, UTE					
	11/02/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE		
VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	PS191.00017	COOK, ROBERT TOTAL		0.20		
		CRAWFORD, ROBERT E.				
		VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SIMMS AND RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/13/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. RALPH SIMMS AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	PS191.00017	VANCE, UTE	11/29/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.50	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (4); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.1)	
		CRAWFORD, ROBERT E. TOTAL		1.30		
		DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE				
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	PS191.00096	VANCE, UTE	11/05/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICES REGARDING PAYMENT OF AWARD AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY	
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE	
		HARRISON, TINA	11/15/2012	0.80	PREPARE SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED AUTHORIZATION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FORWARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS	
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/16/2012	0.20	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL (.1)	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.70	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF REQUEST FOR HEARING, CONTINUED LITIGATION; REVIEW STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD REQUESTS AND MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED TO DATE	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00037	VANCE, UTE	11/30/2012	0.50	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AMENDED AWARD OF BENEFITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AMENDED AWARD ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.2)
		DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE TOTAL HARVEY, MILTON C.		2.90	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00037	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE OF DR. WHEELER'S READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/05/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/05/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1)
		HARVEY, MILTON C. TOTAL KINCAID, MILTON		0.80	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00008	VANCE, UTE	11/09/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		KINCAID, MILTON TOTAL LOUDERMILK, PAUL W.		0.20	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00009	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		LOUDERMILK, PAUL W. TOTAL MILLER, DAVID (LADONNA)		0.10	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00022	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.40	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE DISMISSING CASE; COMPARE WITH PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS RE STATUS OF CASE; CHECK FOR ANY CONTACT WITH OR INFORMATION ABOUT STATUS OF CLAIMANT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
Patriot Coal Corporation	P5191.00051	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/19/2012	0.20	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND EMAIL UNDERWRITERS RE SAME		
		VANCE, UTE	11/19/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REMAND ORDER AND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR'S CLOSING ORDER TO UNDERWRITERS (.2)		
		MILLER, DAVID (LADONNA) TOTAL		0.90			
Patriot Coal Corporation	P5191.00016	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/01/2012	0.60	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW HEARING TRANSCRIPT RE POST HEARING EVIDENCE AND DEADLINES; CHECK STATUS OF FILMS AND REPORTS; DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY		
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/27/2012	0.20	DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL FOR SECOND CONSULTING OPINION		
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/28/2012	0.30	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. WHEELER (-2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE AND MATERIALS TO DR. WHEELER (.1)		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.40	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AVAILABLE IN OUR POSSESSION, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; DESIGNATE FILMS FOR CONSULTING REPORT		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/28/2012	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS WITH FILMS		
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION		
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/28/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	11/28/2012	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR INFORMATION PERTAINING TO PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND DRAFTING INITIAL PREHEARING REPORT PURSUANT TO PENDING DEADLINE		
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	11/29/2012	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM		
				TURNER, JOSEPH D. TOTAL		4.20	
				WELCH, RUSSELL J. V. EACC			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00063	VANCE, UTE	11/02/2012	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		VANCE, UTE	11/08/2012	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	11/15/2012	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT THIS TIME (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING STATUS OF RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES (1); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FACILITIES AND PHYSICIANS NAMED BY CLAIMANT (4)
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00063	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.20	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	11/16/2012	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.50	REVIEWING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (2); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (2)
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00063	VANCE, UTE	11/16/2012	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BRAWLEY, LEIGH	11/19/2012	0.20	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
WELCH, RUSSELL J. V. EACC TOTAL				2.50	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				18.60	
BLACK LUNG TOTAL				507.60	
COMMERCIAL					
<hr/>					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00063	2012 LOAN TRANSACTION			
	D'ANTONI, MARK B.		10/26/2012	2.20	WORKING ON CONTRACT ASSIGNMENT ISSUES (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAVIS POLK CONCERNING SAME (2)
	CRISLIP, ANNA		11/05/2012	2.00	REVISED UCC-3 TERMINATION STATEMENTS
	D'ANTONI, MARK B.		11/06/2012	3.00	WORKING ON UCC PROPERTY DESCRIPTION.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/07/2012	2.00	WORKING ON UCC PROPERTY DESCRIPTION
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/08/2012	2.00	WORKING ON UCC TERMINATIONS
		HARRISON, KRISTEN	11/08/2012	0.80	REVIEW OF UCC TERMINATIONS TO BE FILED
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/09/2012	2.50	WORKING ON UCC TERMINATIONS
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/12/2012	2.50	WORKING ON UCC TERMINATION PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONS
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/13/2012	1.90	WORKING ON UCC LEIN ISSUES.
		HARRISON, KRISTEN	11/14/2012	0.60	PREPARING LETTER AND UCC TERMINATIONS TO BE MAILED TO GINA PAK PER MARK DANTONI
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/14/2012	1.80	WORKING ON UCC LEIN ISSUES.
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/15/2012	1.00	WORKING ON UCC LEIN ISSUES.
		CRISLIP, ANNA	11/15/2012	0.90	EVALUATED THE UCC STATEMENTS FILED WITH THE WEST VIRGINIA SECRETARY OF STATE IN PREPARATION OF DRAFTING THE UCC-3 TERMINATION STATEMENTS
		TAWNEY, AMY J.	11/15/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH M. D'ANTONI AND A. CRISLIP RE: PREPARATION OF TERMINATION STATEMENTS FOR FILING WITH WV SECRETARY OF STATE.
		DEJARNETT, DAVID A.	11/15/2012	0.80	PREPARING UCC-3 TERMINATION STATEMENT FOR FIFTH THIRD VA UCC
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/16/2012	1.00	WORKING ON UCC LEIN ISSUES.
		CRISLIP, ANNA	11/19/2012	1.10	DRAFTED UCC TERMINATION STATEMENTS
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/19/2012	3.00	WORKING ON LIEN ISSUES
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/20/2012	0.60	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. IMMERMANN RE: TERMINATION OF THE FIFTH THIRD FINANCING STATEMENTS (2); CONFERENCE WITH A. CRISLIP RE: SAME (2); REVIEW TERMINATION STATEMENT (2).
		CRISLIP, ANNA	11/20/2012	3.80	REVIEWED UCC FILINGS WITH THE WEST VIRGINIA SECRETARY OF STATE AND PREPARED UCC-3 TERMINATION STATEMENTS
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/20/2012	2.50	WORKING ON UCC LIEN MATTER
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/21/2012	2.80	WORKING ON UCC LIEN MATTER
		CRISLIP, ANNA	11/26/2012	0.80	PREPARED UCC TERMINATION STATEMENTS
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/26/2012	0.20	CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: UCC TERMINATIONS (2).
				40.00	
2012 LOAN TRANSACTION TOTAL					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5523.00001	FIRM RETENTION			
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/08/2012	0.30	WORK ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (3).

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/13/2012	0.90	WORK ON THIRD FEE STATEMENT (2); WORK ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.7)
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/14/2012	2.80	WORK ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (2.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (.2).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/15/2012	2.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM C. ROBERTSON RE: FEE STATEMENT (2); WORK ON FEE APPLICATION (2.0).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/16/2012	3.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. WALLER (2); WORK ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (2.7); CORRESPONDENCE FROM C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (1).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/19/2012	0.40	WORK ON THIRD FEE STATEMENT (2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LINDEN RE: SAME (2).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/20/2012	0.50	WORK ON THIRD FEE STATEMENT (.5).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/27/2012	1.20	WORK ON THIRD FEE STATEMENT (1.2).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/29/2012	1.00	WORK ON THIRD FEE STATEMENT (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. ROBERTSON RE: FILING THE FEE STATEMENT, ET AL. (2); CORRESPONDENCE TO C. ROBERTSON RE: THIRD FEE STATEMENT (1); CORRESPONDENCE TO E. WALLER, ET AL., RE: SAME AND COST SPREADSHEET (2).
FIRM RETENTION TOTAL				12.40	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				52.40	
COMMERCIAL TOTAL				52.40	
ENERGY					
<hr/>					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00001	GENERAL REPRESENTATION			
		MCNAB, J. BRETON	11/08/2012	0.60	ANALYZING ISSUES REGARDING RIGHT OF RE-ENTRY FOR COMPLETING RECLAMATION.
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/08/2012	1.00	DRAFTING ANALYSIS OF RIGHT OF ENTRY ISSUE FOR J. EAGAN.
		MCNAB, J. BRETON	11/14/2012	1.70	ANALYZING LEGAL ISSUES INVOLVING SUBLEASES AND ASSIGNMENTS.
GENERAL REPRESENTATION TOTAL				3.30	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00066	MECHANIC'S LIENS			
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/13/2012	0.90	REVIEW MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER, D. KLEIN, ET AL. (.4); CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM J. TUCKER RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. TUCKER RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. KLEIN RE: SAME (1).

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/14/2012	1.60	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. TUCKER, ET AL., RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO R. MCWILLIAMS RE: SAME (1); REVIEW UPDATED INFORMATION FROM J. TUCKER (2); CONFERENCE WITH B. FREUND RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. MARTIN RE: SAME (2).
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/15/2012	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. EAGAN RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (2).
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/16/2012	1.50	REVIEW MECHANIC'S LIENS (1.3); CONFERENCE WITH C. HUGHES RE: REVIEW SAME FOR COMPLIANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA LAW (2).
HUGHES, CHARLES		HUGHES, CHARLES	11/16/2012	1.50	BEGIN INITIAL REVIEW OF MECHANIC'S LIENS NOTICED BY VARIOUS CLAIMANTS
COHN, DANIEL		COHN, DANIEL	11/16/2012	0.40	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK TO REVIEW COUNTIES AND STATES OF MECHANIC'S LIENS
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/19/2012	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM J. TUCKER RE: SAME (3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM C. HUGHES RE: STATUS OF REVIEW (1).
HUGHES, CHARLES		HUGHES, CHARLES	11/19/2012	1.80	CONTINUE REVIEW ALL MECHANIC'S LIENS TO IDENTIFY DUPLICATE LIENS FILED IN MULTIPLE COUNTIES;
HUGHES, CHARLES		HUGHES, CHARLES	11/20/2012	8.70	CONTINUE WITH DETAILED REVIEW OF ALL MECHANIC'S LIENS (2.5 HRS.); REVIEW EACH FOR COMPLIANCE WITH MECHANIC'S LIEN ACT (2.5 HRS.); RESEARCH SERVICE VIA WV SOS, RESEARCH ONLINE RECORDS OF MONONGALIA COUNTY CLERK AS TO CERTAIN LIENS PROVIDED WITHOUT RECORD (7); CREATE TABLE SUMMARIZING FINDINGS FOR EACH LIEN (3.0)
HUGHES, CHARLES		HUGHES, CHARLES	11/26/2012	0.20	REVISE MECHANIC'S LIEN TABLE TO INCLUDE NOTES RE: LIKELIHOOD OF ENFORCEABILITY
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW REVISED CHART RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS FILED AGAINST PATRIOT (4); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. TUCKER RE: SAME (1).
D'ANTONI, MARK B.		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/27/2012	1.00	WORKING ON MECHANIC'S LIEN ISSUES
HUGHES, CHARLES		HUGHES, CHARLES	11/27/2012	0.60	REVIEW WV CODE 38-2-31 RE: LABORER'S LIEN AGAINST CORPORATION;
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/27/2012	1.10	CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. TUCKER RE: SAME (2); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI, C. HUGHES RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (7); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. TUCKER RE: SAME (2).
D'ANTONI, MARK B.		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/28/2012	1.50	WORKING ON MECHANIC'S LIEN ENFORCEABILITY ISSUES

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/28/2012	0.50	CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. TUCKER RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (2); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (3).
		D'ANTONI, MARK B.	11/29/2012	0.50	WORKING ON MECHANIC'S LIEN ENFORCEABILITY ISSUES
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/30/2012	0.40	CORRESPONDENCE TO J. TUCKER, ET AL., RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS (1), MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. WILLIAMS RE: SAME (1).
				23.30	
MECHANIC'S LIENS TOTAL					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00059	SALE OF SHREWSBURY PROPERTY TO PARDEE RESOUR			
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/01/2012	1.00	PREPARING TRANSACTION DOCUMENTS.
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/01/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: NOTICE OF SALE TO PARDEE (2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE (2) FROM J. EAGAN RE: SAME (1).
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/05/2012	3.50	DRAFTING AND REVISING DOCUMENTS PER COMMENT FROM J. EAGAN.
		ROSE, HERSCHEL	11/06/2012	0.40	REVIEWED OPTION(2) TO LEASE AND CREATED DOCUMENT TO SEND TO J. EAGAN(2)
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/07/2012	1.30	TELEPHONE CALL WITH EAGAN AND C. EBITINO REVIEWING CHANGES TO DEED AND PROVIDING COMMENTS.
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/08/2012	4.50	REVIEWING AND COMMENTING ON CHANGES TO DEED AND PARDEE ISSUES(4); TELEPHONE CALL HERLIHY, RE: TRANSACTION ISSUES (.5)
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/08/2012	0.50	CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. COCO RE: PARDEE SALE (1); REVIEW NOTICE OF SALE (.2);
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/09/2012	2.00	CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM K. COCO RE: SAME (2) REVISING DEED(1.5) AND CONSULTING J. EAGAN REGARDING CHANGES (.5)
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/14/2012	1.00	CONFERENCE RE: PARDEE MARK-UP OF DOCUMENTS.
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/16/2012	1.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. EAGAN RE: PARDEE MARK-UP OF DOCUMENTS.
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/19/2012	3.00	REVIEWING PARDEE MARK-UP AND ASSESSING.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/20/2012	3.30	REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO PARDEE PURCHASE AGREEMENT (2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE (2) FROM J.T. LANE RE: SAME (2); OBTAIN AND REVIEW MOTION AND ORDER APPROVING SALE OF DE MINIMIS ASSETS (5); CONFERENCE WITH J.T. LANE RE: PARDEE SALE (2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. EBETINO, J. EAGAN AND J.T. LANE RE: PARDEE SALE ISSUES (8); TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. COCO RE: SAME (4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. HERLIHY RE: SAME (2); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: SAME (6); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. EAGAN, C. EBETINO, J.T. LANE RE: SAME (2).
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/20/2012	3.30	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING PATRIOT CHANGES AND BANKRUPTCY ISSUES (3.0) AND CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN AND C. EBETINO.(3.0)
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/21/2012	0.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. COCO AND W. HERLIHY RE: PARDEE SALE ISSUES (2); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. EAGAN, C. EBETINO AND T. LANE RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM C. EBETINO RE: SAME (1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. EAGAN, T. LANE RE: SAME (2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: SAME (2).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/26/2012	1.60	REVISE SALE AGREEMENT (1.2); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM J. EAGAN RE: SAME (4).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: SALE (2).
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/28/2012	0.60	ASSESSING BANKRUPTCY NOTICE ISSUE.
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/28/2012	0.30	MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO K. COCO RE: PARDEE SALE (3).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/29/2012	0.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, REVISED DOCUMENTS FROM W. HERLIHY (3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. EAGAN RE: SAME (2).
		MCNAB, J. BRETON	11/30/2012	1.20	WRITING WHEELAGE CONTRACT FOR TRANSPORTATION OF FOREIGN COAL.
		LANE, J. THOMAS	11/30/2012	8.00	REVIEWING AND REVISING DOCUMENTS(4.0); CONFERENCE WITH PURCHASER(1.5); DRAFTING NEW AGREEMENT.(2.5)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>									
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00065	CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	11/30/2012	2.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. EBETINO, J. EAGAN AND T. LANE RE: PARDEE TRANSACTION (1); REVIEW DEED REVISIONS (2); CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: SAME (2); CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLEN OF PARDEE (3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH W. HERLIHY RE: SAME (1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. COCO RE: PARDEE SALE (1).									
					SALE OF SHREWSBURY PROPERTY TO PARDEE RESOURCES TOTAL90									
					SIERRA CLUB MINING AGREEMENT									
					LANE, J. THOMAS	11/12/2012	1.00	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CURRENT DRAFT OF CONSENT ORDER(40), MOTION AND GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT(20); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MCCALLISTER(30)						
					LANE, J. THOMAS	11/13/2012	5.00	REVIEWING REVISED CONSENT DECREE AND RELATED DOCUMENTS(3.5) AND ASSESSING LEASE ISSUES (1.3). TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MCCALLISTER.(2)						
					SIERRA CLUB MINING AGREEMENT TOTAL				6.00					
					PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				73.50					
					ENERGY TOTAL				73.50					
					LITIGATION									
					PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00061	COHN, DANIEL	11/13/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK RE: FEE STATEMENT				
PANTHER BRANCH COAL COMPANY AND														
PANTHER BRANCH COAL COMPANY AND TOTAL														
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				0.30										
LITIGATION TOTAL				0.30										
SAFETY AND HEALTH														
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00066	HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619	11/01/2012	0.30						REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE (OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR DEPOSITIONS PENDING OR SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID FILE CLAIM;(20) UPDATE STATUS SHEET REGARDING(10)SAME;				
										ROTRUCK, ROBIN				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	11/12/2012	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO MS. TANYA WHISNANT (XC: SOLICITOR MORHOLT, ATTORNEYS KILPATRICK, CIMINO, OAKLEY AND BRAD) PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING REQUEST FOR RESCHEDULING OF THE CONFERENCE CALL SCHEDULED FOR NOVEMBER 15TH DUE TO DEPOSITIONS THAT ATTORNEY OBLAK IS ATTENDING WHICH WERE RESCHEDULED DUE TO HURRICANE SANDY;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/12/2012	0.20	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER WITH DIRECTIVES TO CONTACT ALL PARTIES AND JUDGE FELDMAN'S OFFICE THAT ATTORNEY OBLAK WILL BE IN BIRMINGHAM, ALABAMA THIS ENTIRE WEEK IN DEPOSITIONS AND TRIAL THE FOLLOWING WEEK WITH JUDGE MCCARTHY AND THAT SHE WILL NOT BE AVAILABLE FOR THE NOVEMBER 15TH SCHEDULED CONFERENCE CALL WITH THE PARTIES;(10) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE AVAILABLE DATES FOR RESCHEDULING OF SAME, ET CETERA;(10)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/19/2012	1.10	<p>REVIEW THE CALENDAR REGARDING THE UPCOMING CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE PARTIES REGARDING THE STATUS OF THESE TWO REMAINING ISSUES (ALLEGED CITATION NUMBER 6692995 AND ALLEGED ORDER NUMBER 8489217(.10)); REVIEW THE STATUS SHEETS/FILES REGARDING THE MOTIONS FILED BY THE PARTIES REGARDING THE SECTION 110(C) SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS (MR. SHEFFIELD AND MR. BOCKHORN) AND THE RELATION TO THE OPERATOR'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY RESPONSES FROM MR. COBURN AND POTENTIALLY FROM THE DISTRICT MANGER REGARDING MR. COBURN PRIOR TESTIMONY THAT HE WOULDN'T HAVE ISSUED THE ALLEGED ORDER, ET CETERA(.40); REVIEW THE FILE IN PREPARATION REGARDING THE OUTSTANDING MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN BY THE PARTIES, THE FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH REVIEW COMMISSION DECISIONS REGARDING THE LLC ISSUE AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS AND THE PRIOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN ON JANUARY 18, 2011 PRIOR TO HIS STAY OF THE PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW THE CALENDAR FOR POTENTIAL FUTURE DEPOSITIONS (OF THE SECRETARY'S WITNESS MR. MARK ODUM AND HIS POSITION WITH MSHA, AND THE FACTS SURROUNDING HIS POSITION AS A WITNESS OF THE SECRETARY'S PRE-HEARING REPORT, ET CETERA(.40); NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING THE FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME AND TO CONTACT SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF THE REMAINING TWO ALLEGED VIOLATIONS AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS(.20);</p>

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	1.80	REVIEW FILE IN CONJUNCTION WITH DOCKET KENT 2009-168 REGARDING THE CONFERENCE NOTES FROM THE JANUARY 18, 2011 CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE DEFENSE ATTORNEYS REPRESENTING THE TWO ALLEGED SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS AND THEIR OUTSTANDING MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN(.80); REVIEW THE OPERATOR'S OUTSTANDING MOTION TO COMPEL DEPOSITION RESPONSES REQUESTING A RULING UPON THE SECRETARY'S "DELIBERATE INTENT PRIVILEGE" AND COAL MINE INSPECTOR COBURN'S TESTIMONY THAT HE DID NOT SEE THE ALLEGED UNDERLYING CONDITIONS AND WOULD NOT HAVE ISSUED SAID ALLEGED VIOLATIONS, ET CETERA(.70); NOTATIONS TO FILE TO DISCUSS WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING COPIES OF THE DEFENSE COUNSEL'S MOTIONS REGARDING THE SPECIALS INVESTIGATIONS OF THE TWO MANAGEMENT OFFICIALS, ET CETERA(.30)
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	2.10	REVIEW ALLEGED CITATION NUMBER 6692995, "PROTECTION FROM FALLS" (75.202(A)) IN DOCKET KENT 2008-619 IN PREPARATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR NEIL MORHOLT TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 27TH PRIOR TO CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE STATUS OF THIS DOCKET(.50); REVIEW THE STATUS SHEET AND ATTORNEY OBLAK'S NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING HER LAST CONFERENCE IN NASHVILLE WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THIS REMAINING ALLEGED ORDER, ET CETERA(.60); REVIEW FILE FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK'S NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH MINE MANAGEMENT REGARDING THIS ALLEGED ORDER, FACTS SURROUNDING SAME AND POTENTIAL FOR SETTLEMENT OF SAME(.50) REVIEW NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING THE TWO (2) ALLEGED SECTION 110(C) SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS SURROUNDING THIS ALLEGED VIOLATION, ET CETERA(.50)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.60	REVIEW PARTIAL FINAL SETTLEMENT OF CONFERENCE WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT IN NASHVILLE IN 2011 REGARDING THE TWO REMAINING ALLEGED VIOLATIONS LEFT IN THESE TWO DOCKETS AND POTENTIAL FOR SETTLEMENT OF SAME(.30); DRAFT THE OPERATOR'S POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OFFER TO THE SECRETARY IN PREPARATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT PRIOR TO CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE COUNSEL REGARDING SAME;(.30) CONFERENCE CALL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE FOLLOWING: (1) TODAY'S STATUS CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND POTENTIAL DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME; (2) THE FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH REVIEW COMMISSION DECISION REGARDING THE LLC AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATION ISSUE THAT WAS RENDERED AND JUDGE FELDMAN SHOULD REMOVE SAID STAY IN THESE TWO DOCKETS; (3) THE TWO SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS PENDING AGAINST MR. MARK SHEFFIELD AND MR. STEVE BOCKHORN REPRESENTED BY OUTSIDE COUNSEL, BUT AS IT RELATES TO POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THESE TWO DOCKETS AND THE UNDERLYING ALLEGED TWO VIOLATIONS; (4) DISCOVERY ISSUES THAT ARE PENDING; (5) MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN THAT ARE PENDING; (5) REVIEW PROFESSIONAL CALENDARS REGARDING MUTUALLY AGREEABLE DATES FOR HEARING IN EVANSVILLE, INDIANA IN 2013; (6) THE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT OF THE PARTIES AND FAILURE OF JUDGE FELDMAN TO SIGN PARTIAL SETTLEMENT ORDER; (7) MSHA'S POSITION REGARDING POTENTIALLY SETTling THESE TWO DOCKETS DUE TO THE AGED OF BOTH OF THE DOCKETS; (8) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING MSHA SETTLEMENT OF THE SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS AGAINST MR. BOCKHORN AND MR. SHEFFIELD, ET CETERA; AND, (9) FUTURE CONFERENCE CALL TODAY WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE PARTIES REGARDING FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.50	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM LEGAL ASSISTANT WHINSLET FROM JUDGE FELDMAN'S OFFICE REGARDING THE CONFERENCE CALL NUMBER FOR THIS MORNING; DRAFT EMAIL TO MS. WHINSLET REGARDING SAME;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE (X2) TO NO AVAIL;(10); CONFERENCE CALL TO SOLICITOR TOM GROOMS (X2) OFFICE MAIN NUMBER TO NO AVAIL AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S CELL PHONE NUMBER AND LEFT MESSAGE THAT OFFICE TELEPHONES ARE NOT WORKING AND REQUEST TO RETURN CALL TO ATTORNEY OBLAK, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING JUDGE FELDMAN'S CONFERENCE CALL AND THE POTENTIAL OF THE PARTIES AND MSHA TO POTENTIALLY SETTLE THESE TWO DOCKETS WITH SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS DUE TO THE LENGTH OF TIME LAPSE AND DIFFICULTY WITH LOCATING WITNESSES, DOCUMENTS, ET CETERA TO TRIAL SAME; DISCUSSIONS REGARDING JUDGE FELDMAN'S RECOMMENDATIONS, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.50	NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING CONFERENCE CALLS WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND JUDGE FELDMAN;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.40	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE DEPOSITION OF MR. MARK ODUM AND OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY IN THIS DOCKET;(10); RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL RESPONSE FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME; DRAFT EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME AND FUTURE DISCUSSIONS REGARDING POTENTIAL TO SETTLE THESE TWO DOCKETS;(10) RECEIPT AND REVIEW SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S RESPONSE THAT HE WILL BE IN FUTURE CONTACT WITH ATTORNEY OBLAK AND WILL CONTACT HIS CLIENT REGARDING THESE "OLD" DOCKETS AND TWO SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS PER ATTORNEY OBLAK'S RECOMMENDATION TO SETTLE, ET CETERA;(10)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN, ATTORNEYS CIMINO, KILPATRICK, OBLAK AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE FOLLOWING: (1) THE PARTIES' REPRESENTATION OF WHAT RULED BY THE COMMISSION REGARDING THE STAY PENDING IN THIS DOCKET; (3) QUESTIONS OF THE JUDGE REGARDING THE APPEAL BY EITHER OF THE PARTIES REGARDING THE COMMISSION DECISION; (4) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE DEFENSE COUNSEL'S REQUEST TO DEPOSE MSHA'S WITNESS PER HIS PRE-HEARING ORDER REGARDING MR. ODUM AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S REVIEW OF SAME IF WITNESS IS STILL REQUIRED, ET CETERA; (5) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE POSITIONS OF COUNSEL REGARDING THE OUTSTANDING MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS; (6) THE OPERATOR'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY RESPONSES; (7) JANUARY 15, 2013 DATE FOR FILING OF ATTORNEY KILPATRICK'S MOTION TO JOIN ATTORNEY CIMINO'S PENDING MOTION AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S FEBRUARY 15, 2013 DATE TO RESPOND TO SAME; (8) THE APRIL 9, 2013 PENDING HEARING IN EVANSVILLE; (9) THAT DISCOVERY OF THE PARTIES SHOULD CLOSE ON MARCH 14, 2013; (10) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE PARTIES GOOD FAITH ABILITY TO SETTLE MOST OF THESE TWO DOCKET AND REQUEST THEY CONTINUE WITH SAME WITH THE REMAINING TWO ALLEGED VIOLATIONS; (11) JUDGE FELDMAN'S REQUEST TO CONTACT HIS LEGAL ASSISTANT AND NUMBER REGARDING SAME; AND, (12) FINAL DISCUSSIONS AND ISSUES PENDING REGARDING THESE TWO DOCKETS;
				8.60	
					HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619 TOTAL
					HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168
					ROTRUCK, ROBIN
			11/01/2012	0.20	REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE (OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR DEPOSITIONS PENDING OR SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID FILE CLAIM;
			11/01/2012	0.10	UPDATE STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME;
					ROTRUCK, ROBIN

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION

E1166.00071

HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168

ROTRUCK, ROBIN

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	11/12/2012	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO MS. TANYA WHISNANT (XC: SOLICITOR MORHOLT, ATTORNEYS KILPATRICK, CIMINO, OAKLEY AND BRAD) PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING REQUEST FOR RESCHEDULING OF THE CONFERENCE CALL SCHEDULED FOR NOVEMBER 15TH DUE TO DEPOSITIONS THAT ATTORNEY OBLAK IS ATTENDING WHICH WERE RESCHEDULED DUE TO HURRICANE SANDY;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/12/2012	0.10	DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE AVAILABLE DATES FOR RESCHEDULING OF SAME, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/12/2012	0.10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER WITH DIRECTIVES TO CONTACT ALL PARTIES AND JUDGE FELDMAN'S OFFICE THAT ATTORNEY OBLAK WILL BE IN BIRMINGHAM, ALABAMA THIS ENTIRE WEEK IN DEPOSITIONS AND TRIAL THE FOLLOWING WEEK WITH JUDGE MCCARTHY AND THAT SHE WILL NOT BE AVAILABLE FOR THE NOVEMBER 15TH SCHEDULED CONFERENCE CALL WITH THE PARTIES;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/19/2012	0.10	REVIEW THE CALENDAR REGARDING THE UPCOMING CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE PARTIES REGARDING THE STATUS OF THESE TWO REMAINING ISSUES (ALLEGED CITATION NUMBER 6692995 AND ALLEGED ORDER NUMBER 8489217);
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/19/2012	0.40	REVIEW THE STATUS SHEETS/FILES REGARDING THE MOTIONS FILED BY THE PARTIES REGARDING THE SECTION 110(C) SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS (MR. SHEFFIELD AND MR. BOCKHORN) AND THE RELATION TO THE OPERATOR'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY RESPONSES FROM MR. COBURN AND POTENTIALLY FROM THE DISTRICT MANGER REGARDING MR. COBURN PRIOR TESTIMONY THAT HE WOULDN'T HAVE ISSUED THE ALLEGED ORDER, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/19/2012	0.40	REVIEW THE FILE IN PREPARATION REGARDING THE OUTSTANDING MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN BY THE PARTIES, THE FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH REVIEW COMMISSION DECISIONS REGARDING THE LLC ISSUE AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS AND THE PRIOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN ON JANUARY 18, 2011 PRIOR TO HIS STAY OF THE PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW THE CALENDAR FOR POTENTIAL FUTURE DEPOSITIONS (OF THE SECRETARY'S WITNESS MR. MARK ODUM AND HIS POSITION WITH MSHA, AND THE FACTS SURROUNDING HIS POSITION AS A WITNESS OF THE SECRETARY'S PRE-HEARING REPORT, ET CETERA;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/19/2012	0.20	NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING THE FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME AND TO CONTACT SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF THE REMAINING TWO ALLEGED VIOLATIONS AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING THE TWO (2) ALLEGED SECTION 110(C) SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS SURROUNDING THIS ALLEGED VIOLATION, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW ALLEGED ORDER NUMBER 8489217 "ROOF SUPPORT REMOVAL" (75.212(C)(2)) IN DOCKET KENT 2009-168, IN PREPARATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR NEIL MORHOLT TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 27TH PRIOR TO CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE STATUS OF THIS DOCKET;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	0.60	REVIEW THE STATUS SHEET AND ATTORNEY OBLAK'S NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING HER LAST CONFERENCE IN NASHVILLE WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THIS REMAINING ALLEGED ORDER, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/26/2012	0.50	REVIEW FILE FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK'S NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH MINE MANAGEMENT REGARDING THIS ALLEGED ORDER, FACTS SURROUNDING SAME AND POTENTIAL FOR SETTLEMENT OF SAME;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.50	<p>CONFERENCE CALL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE FOLLOWING: (1) TODAY'S STATUS CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND POTENTIAL DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME; (2) THE FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH REVIEW COMMISSION DECISION REGARDING THE LLC AND SPECIAL INVESTIGATION ISSUE THAT WAS RENDERED AND JUDGE FELDMAN SHOULD REMOVE SAID STAY IN THESE TWO DOCKETS; (3) THE TWO SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS PENDING AGAINST MR. MARK SHEFFIELD AND MR. STEVE BOCKHORN REPRESENTED BY OUTSIDE COUNSEL, BUT AS IT RELATES TO POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THESE TWO DOCKETS AND THE UNDERLYING ALLEGED TWO VIOLATIONS; (4) DISCOVERY ISSUES THAT ARE PENDING; (5) MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN THAT ARE PENDING; (5) REVIEW PROFESSIONAL CALENDARS REGARDING MUTUALLY AGREEABLE DATES FOR HEARING IN EVANSVILLE, INDIANA IN 2013; (6) THE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT OF THE PARTIES AND FAILURE OF JUDGE FELDMAN TO SIGN PARTIAL SETTLEMENT ORDER; (7) MSHA'S POSITION REGARDING POTENTIALLY SETTling THESE TWO DOCKETS DUE TO THE AGED OF BOTH OF THE DOCKETS; (8) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING MSHA SETTLEMENT OF THE SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS AGAINST MR. BOCKHORN AND MR. SHEFFIELD, ET CETERA; AND, (9) FUTURE CONFERENCE CALL TODAY WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE PARTIES REGARDING FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME;</p>

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN, ATTORNEYS CIMINO, KILPATRICK, OBLAK AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE FOLLOWING: (1) THE PARTIES' REPRESENTATION OF WHAT PERSONS/PARTIES; (2) THE LLC ISSUE THAT WAS RULED BY THE COMMISSION REGARDING THE STAY PENDING IN THIS DOCKET, (3) QUESTIONS OF THE JUDGE REGARDING THE APPEAL BY EITHER OF THE PARTIES REGARDING THE COMMISSION DECISION; (4) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE DEFENSE COUNSEL'S REQUEST TO DEPOSE MSHA'S WITNESS PER HIS PRE-HEARING ORDER REGARDING MR. ODUM AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S REVIEW OF SAME IF WITNESS IS STILL REQUIRED, ET CETERA; (5) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE POSITIONS OF COUNSEL REGARDING THE OUTSTANDING MOTIONS BEFORE JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS; (6) THE OPERATOR'S MOTION TO COMPEL DISCOVERY RESPONSES; (7) JANUARY 15, 2013 DATE FOR FILING OF ATTORNEY KILPATRICK'S MOTION TO JOIN ATTORNEY CIMINO'S PENDING MOTION AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S FEBRUARY 15, 2013 DATE TO RESPOND TO SAME; (8) THE APRIL 9, 2013 PENDING HEARING IN EVANSVILLE; (9) THAT DISCOVERY OF THE PARTIES SHOULD CLOSE ON MARCH 14, 2013; (10) DISCUSSIONS REGARDING THE PARTIES GOOD FAITH ABILITY TO SETTLE MOST OF THESE TWO DOCKET AND REQUEST THEY CONTINUE WITH SAME WITH THE REMAINING TWO ALLEGED VIOLATIONS; (11) JUDGE FELDMAN'S REQUEST TO CONTACT HIS LEGAL ASSISTANT AND NUMBER REGARDING SAME; AND, (12) FINAL DISCUSSIONS AND ISSUES PENDING REGARDING THESE TWO DOCKETS;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.50	NOTATIONS TO FILE REGARDING CONFERENCE CALLS WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND JUDGE FELDMAN;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	REVIEW PARTIAL FINAL SETTLEMENT OF CONFERENCE WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT IN NASHVILLE IN 2011 REGARDING THE TWO REMAINING ALLEGED VIOLATIONS LEFT IN THESE TWO DOCKETS AND POTENTIAL FOR SETTLEMENT OF SAME;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S RESPONSE THAT HE WILL BE IN FUTURE CONTACT WITH ATTORNEY OBLAK AND WILL CONTACT HIS CLIENT REGARDING THESE "OLD" DOCKETS AND TWO SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS PER ATTORNEY OBLAK'S RECOMMENDATION TO SETTLE, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	DRAFT THE OPERATOR'S POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OFFER TO THE SECRETARY IN PREPARATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT PRIOR TO CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE FELDMAN AND THE COUNSEL REGARDING SAME;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S CELL PHONE NUMBER AND LEFT MESSAGE THAT OFFICE TELEPHONES ARE NOT WORKING AND REQUEST TO RETURN CALL TO ATTORNEY OBLAK, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE DEPOSITION OF MR. MARK ODUM AND OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY IN THIS DOCKET;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL RESPONSE FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	DRAFT EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME AND FUTURE DISCUSSIONS REGARDING POTENTIAL TO SETTLE THESE TWO DOCKETS;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING JUDGE FELDMAN'S CONFERENCE CALL AND THE POTENTIAL OF THE PARTIES AND MSHA TO POTENTIALLY SETTLE THESE TWO DOCKETS WITH SPECIAL INVESTIGATIONS DUE TO THE LENGTH OF TIME LAPSE AND DIFFICULTY WITH LOCATING WITNESSES, DOCUMENTS, ET CETERA TO TRIAL SAME; DISCUSSIONS REGARDING JUDGE FELDMAN'S RECOMMENDATIONS, ET CETERA;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE (X2) TO NO AVAIL AND CONFERENCE CALL TO SOLICITOR TOM GROOMS (X2) OFFICE MAIN NUMBER TO NO AVAIL;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	11/27/2012	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM LEGAL ASSISTANT WHINSLET FROM JUDGE FELDMAN'S OFFICE REGARDING THE CONFERENCE CALL NUMBER FOR THIS MORNING; DRAFT EMAIL TO MS. WHINSLET REGARDING SAME;
HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168 TOTAL				6.80	

NARRATIVE

HOURS

WORK DATE

TIMEKEEPER

MATTER

CLIENT NAME

15.40

15.40

649.20

TOTAL

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL

SAFETY AND HEALTH TOTAL